September 17, 1999

Ex Parte Presentation
Magalie Roman Salas, Esq.

Secretary

Federal Communications Commission

445 12th Street, S.W.

Washington, D.C. 20554

RE:
In the Matter of Applications for Consent to the Transfer of Control of Licenses and Section 214 Authorizations from Ameritech Corporation, Transferor, to SBC Communications Inc., Transferee.


CC Dkt.  No. 98-141

Dear Ms. Salas:


On August 27, 1999, SBC and Ameritech filed with the Commission revised proposed merger conditions.  On September 7, 1999, SBC and Ameritech filed revisions and errata that further clarified and amplified the August 27 proposed conditions.  Based on SBC’s and Ameritech’s ongoing review of the proposed conditions and discussions with interested parties and the Commission Staff, SBC and Ameritech hereby submit the following additional clarifying changes, corrections, and modifications to the August 27 proposed conditions (as amended by the September 7 filing):


On the second page of the Index to Proposed Conditions, delete “XXIII. Enforcement” and insert in lieu thereof “XXVIII. Enforcement”.  Delete “XXIV. Sunset” and insert in lieu thereof “XXIX.  Sunset”.  Delete “XXV. Effect of Conditions” and insert in lieu thereof “XXX. Effect of Conditions”.


In the first line of Paragraph 1, insert after “Advanced Services” the following: “in the SBC/Ameritech Service Area”.


In the second sentence of Paragraph 3, insert after “all transactions” the following: “(including chaining transactions)”.


In Paragraph 3a, insert on line 12, after the phrase “in Paragraphs 15, 19, and 20.”, the following sentence: “In Connecticut, this obligation shall apply consistent with the schedules established in Paragraphs 15 and 20 for deployment of OSS interfaces in Connecticut.”  In line 13, delete “completion of orders for” and insert in lieu thereof “sales and completing the sales function, up to and including the taking of an order, for”.


Delete Subparagraph 3c and insert in lieu thereof the following:



c.
Any SBC/Ameritech incumbent LEC may provide the operations, installation, and maintenance (“OI&M”) services permitted under Paragraph 4 to any separate Advanced Services affiliate on a non-discriminatory basis pursuant to a tariff, written affiliate agreement, or approved interconnection agreement, provided that the same services made available to the separate affiliate are made available to unaffiliated providers of Advanced Services in that state on a non-discriminatory basis consistent with the requirements of 47 U.S.C. § 272(c) and the Commission’s implementing rules as in effect on August 27, 1999, where not inconsistent with the provisions of this Section.  Because such OI&M services are not UNEs and, therefore, are not subject to forward-looking pricing methodologies, they will be priced and made available on a non-discriminatory basis based upon the Commission’s affiliate transaction rules.  The following additional provisions shall apply to the incumbent LEC’s provision of OI&M services:




(1)
With respect to transactions for OI&M services, SBC/Ameritech shall comply with the Commission’s Section 272 accounting safeguards and will continue to do so regardless of, and consistent with, the specific accounting method SBC/Ameritech uses.

(2)
Processes, systems, and procedures made available by the incumbent LEC for use by the separate Advanced Services affiliate to obtain OI&M services from the SBC/Ameritech incumbent LEC under this Subparagraph shall be available for use by unaffiliated providers of Advanced Services in that state on non-discriminatory rates, terms, and conditions.




(3)
In order to provide for an orderly and efficient transfer of personnel and systems to the separate Advanced Services affiliate, for a period of not more than 180 days after the Merger Closing Date, the incumbent LEC may provide, under a written agreement, network planning, engineering, design, and assignment services for Advanced Services Equipment as defined in Subparagraph 3d (including the creation and maintenance of customer records), including the use of systems and databases associated with these services, on an exclusive basis to the separate Advanced Services affiliate.  After 180 days, the separate affiliate shall not obtain such services from any SBC/Ameritech incumbent LEC.  
In the last sentence of Subparagraph 3d, insert after “(“Interim Line Sharing”)” the following: “, including OI&M functions associated with Interim Line Sharing,”.

In the last sentence of Subparagraph 3e, delete “Subparagraph c” and insert in lieu thereof “Subparagraph d”.

In the first line of Subparagraph 3h, delete “12 months” and insert in lieu thereof “up to 12 months”. 

Insert a new Subparagraph 3i, as follows:

i.
Public disclosure of the governing interconnection agreement (including the prices, discounts, terms, and conditions associated with that agreement) shall replace the transaction disclosure requirements (including Internet posting) that otherwise would apply to the incumbent LEC and separate Advanced Services affiliate under Section 272 and the Commission’s implementing rules for facilities and services provided pursuant to such agreement.


In the third line of Subparagraph 4a(5), delete “terms and conditions” and insert in lieu thereof “rates, terms, and conditions”.


In the eighth line of Subparagraph 4a(6), delete “terms and conditions” and insert in lieu thereof “rates, terms, and conditions”.

In the seventh line of Subparagraph 4a(7), delete “terms and conditions” and insert in lieu thereof “rates, terms, and conditions”.

In the third line of Subparagraph 4b, delete “sale of” and insert in lieu thereof “sale of, up to and including the taking of an order for,”.

In the seventh line of Subparagraph 4b(5), delete “interfaces” and insert in lieu thereof “interfaces and associated processes and procedures”.  In the eighth line, delete “made available” and insert in lieu thereof “made available by the incumbent LEC”. 

In the fourth line of Subparagraph 4b(6), delete the phrase “that are made available to the incumbent LEC” and insert in lieu thereof the phrase “that are made available on a non-discriminatory basis by the incumbent LEC”.


In the first line of Subparagraph 4e(1), delete “provides” and insert in lieu thereof “describes”.


In the sixth line of Subparagraph 4j, delete the phrase “on a non-discriminatory basis” and insert in lieu thereof “on non-discriminatory rates, terms, and conditions”.


In the fourth line of Subparagraph 4j(2), delete “associated with and” and insert in lieu thereof “associated with and/or”.


In the seventh line of Subparagraph 4j(2), delete “the incumbent LEC shall provide the same referral or transfer services to an unaffiliated provider of Advanced Services, if known, on a non-discriminatory basis.” and insert in lieu thereof: “the incumbent LEC shall offer the same referral or transfer services to unaffiliated providers of Advanced Services on non-discriminatory rates, terms, and conditions.”.


In the last sentence of Subparagraph 4j(2), delete “CLEC” and insert “requesting Advanced Services provider”.


In the second line of Subparagraph 4k, delete “owns” and insert in lieu thereof “owns or leases”.  In the fourth line, delete “owned” and insert in lieu thereof “owned or leased”.  In the sixth line, delete “provide” and insert in lieu thereof  “offer to provide”.


In the fifth line of Subparagraph 4l, delete “may”.


In the third line of Subparagraph 4n(1), insert after “Subparagraph 3d)” the following: “, including OI&M functions associated with Interim Line Sharing,”.


In Subparagraph 4n(4), delete all after “provide” and insert in lieu thereof:  “network planning, engineering, design, and assignment services for Advanced Services Equipment (including the creation and maintenance of customer records), to the separate Advanced Services affiliate for a period of no more than 180 days after the Merger Closing Date.”

In the last line of Subparagraph 4n(5), delete “terms and conditions” and insert in lieu thereof “rates, terms, and conditions”.


In the third line of Subparagraph 5e, delete “providing Advanced Services in that state.” and insert in lieu thereof “the Merger Closing Date.”


Delete Subparagraph 6h.


In the third line of Paragraph 8, delete “Paragraph 3d)” and insert in lieu thereof the following: “Subparagraph 3d), including OI&M functions associated with Interim Line Sharing,”.


In the sixth and seventh lines of Subparagraph 12b, delete “an affiliate” each time it appears and insert in lieu thereof “the separate Advanced Services affiliate”.


In the fourteenth line of Subparagraph 14b, delete all after “30 days” and insert in lieu thereof the following: “of the date that SBC/Ameritech notifies the telecommunications carrier that the Surrogate Line Sharing Charges are in effect.  Not less than 3 business days after the availability of Surrogate Line Sharing Charges, SBC/Ameritech shall provide notice of that availability to telecommunications carriers having unbundled loops in service as of the effective date of the Surrogate Line Sharing Charges.”


In the third line of Subparagraph 14e, delete “not less than” and insert in lieu thereof “no later than”.  In the fourth line, delete “an installation date” and insert in lieu thereof “a requested installation date”.  Insert after the first sentence the following: “In addition, for line sharing installations meeting the requirements of the previous sentence, Surrogate Line Sharing Charges shall continue to apply to the unbundled loop until SBC/Ameritech has completed all work necessary for the conversion to line sharing to be completed.”  


In the second line of Subparagraph 15c, delete “90” and insert in lieu thereof “30”.


In the eighth line of Subparagraph 15c(1)(A), delete “$100,000” and insert in lieu thereof “$110,000”.


Delete the first sentence of Subparagraph 15c(1)(B) and insert in lieu thereof: “If, 90 days after the Merger Closing Date, one or more CLEC(s) has requested enhancements to SBC/Ameritech’s existing Datagate or EDI interfaces that are different from what is contained in the Plan of Record, SBC/Ameritech shall immediately begin Phase 2.”.  Immediately thereafter, delete “If, within 90 days after the Merger Closing Date, no CLEC requests” and insert in lieu thereof “If, 90 days after the Merger Closing Date, no CLEC has requested”.


In the second sentence of Subparagraph 15c(2), delete “target date for completion of Phase 1 both times it appears and insert in lieu thereof “start of Phase 2”.  In the sixth sentence, delete “90” and insert in lieu thereof “30”.  In the sixth sentence delete “dispute, and SBC/Ameritech shall submit” and insert in lieu thereof “dispute.  SBC/Ameritech shall at the same time submit”.


In the last line of Subparagraph 15c(3)(A), delete “$100,000” and insert in lieu thereof “$110,000”.

In the tenth line of Subparagraph 15c(3)(B), delete “$100,000” and insert in lieu thereof “$110,000”.


Add the following new sentences at the end of Paragraph 21: “In SBC/Ameritech States where rates have not been approved by the state commission for the removal of load coils, bridged taps, and/or voice-grade repeaters, SBC/Ameritech shall make available to Advanced Services providers, pending the approval of state-specific rates and subject to true-up, the rates for these xDSL loop conditioning services that are contained in the Arbitration Order, Petition of BroadSpan Communications, Inc. for Arbitration of Unresolved Interconnection Issues Regarding ADSL with Southwestern Bell Telephone Company, Case No. TO-99-370 (Mo. PSC issued June 15, 1999).  Provided, however, that during this interim period and subject to true-up, unbundled loops of less than 12,000 feet, based on theoretical loop length, that do not meet SBC/Ameritech’s design criteria for its tariffed xDSL services but that could be conditioned to meet the minimum requirements defined in the associated SBC/Ameritech technical publications through the removal of local coils, bridged taps, and/or voice-grade repeaters, will be so conditioned at no charge to the requesting Advanced Services provider.  Where an SBC/Ameritech incumbent LEC identifies conditioning (with associated conditioning charges) that is necessary for an unbundled loop ordered by a provider of Advanced Services, SBC/Ameritech will obtain the provider’s authorization to perform, and agreement to pay for, each type of conditioning before proceeding with any conditioning work.  The foregoing interim provisions do not constitute or reflect any determination by the Commission regarding the lawfulness or appropriateness of the interim rates, and are not intended to delay or otherwise influence approval of state-specific rates by other state commissions in the SBC/Ameritech States.”


In the third line of Subparagraph 22b and the third line of Subparagraph 22c, delete “subscribers” and insert in lieu thereof “households”.


In the heading above Paragraph 23, delete “Carrier Interconnection” and insert in lieu thereof “Carrier-to-Carrier”.  Make the same change at the appropriate point on the first page of the Index to Proposed Conditions.


In the seventh line of Paragraph 23, delete “carriers” and insert in lieu thereof “CLECs”.


In Subparagraphs 28a, 28c(2), and 28c(3), delete “$100,000” each time it appears and insert in lieu thereof “$110,000”.


In the sixth sentence of Subparagraph 28b, delete “dispute, and SBC/Ameritech shall submit” and insert in lieu thereof “dispute.  SBC/Ameritech shall at the same time submit”.

In Subparagraphs 31a, 31c(2), and 31c(3), delete “$100,000” each time it appears and insert in lieu thereof “$110,000”.

In the sixth sentence of Subparagraph 31b, delete “dispute, and SBC/Ameritech shall submit” and insert in lieu thereof “dispute.  SBC/Ameritech shall at the same time submit”.


In the last sentence of Paragraph 35, delete “Paragraph 20,” and insert in lieu thereof “Paragraph 20;”.


In the sixth line of Paragraph 41b, delete “acts or” and insert in lieu thereof “Acts of”.


In the sixth line of Paragraph 42, delete “make” and insert in lieu thereof “makes”.  In the same line, delete “obtain” and insert in lieu thereof “obtains”. 


In the thirteenth line of Paragraph 43, delete “that it is available” and insert in lieu thereof “that they are available”.


In the third line of Subparagraph 46e, add after “residential local telephone exchange services” the following: “(and any associated exchange access service)”.


In the second line of Subparagraph 46g, delete “180,000” and insert in lieu thereof “181,000”.  In the third line delete “62,000” and insert in lieu thereof “63,000”.


In the third line of Subparagraph 51d, add after “residential local telephone exchange services” the following: “(and any associated exchange access service)”.    


In Subparagraph 55a, add the following at the beginning of the third sentence: “No later than the Merger Closing Date, ”.


In the fifth line of Subparagraph 59d, delete “$1.1 million” and insert in lieu thereof “$1.1 million for each missed requirement”.  In the sixth line, delete “if an SBC/Ameritech Out-of-Territory Entity fails” and insert in lieu thereof “if SBC/Ameritech Out-of-Territory Entities fail”.


After the seventh sentence of Paragraph 67, insert the following new sentence: “In the event that the Merger Closing Date is later than November 1, 1999, the implementation schedule for the agreed-upon procedures engagement required by this Paragraph shall be revised as follows:  (i)  the independent auditor shall perform an agreed-upon procedures engagement in accordance with the requirements of this Paragraph for the first six months after the Merger Closing Date, and shall submit a report for this audit no later than September 1, 2000, and (ii) the subsequent regularly scheduled agreed-upon procedures engagement shall not cover the first six months after the Merger Closing Date.” 


In the second line of Paragraph 72, delete “showing of” and insert in lieu thereof “showing of good cause by”.


In the title of Attachment A, delete “CARRIER INTERCONNECTION” and insert in lieu thereof “CARRIER-TO-CARRIER”.  Make the same change at the appropriate point on the second page of the Index to Proposed Conditions. 


A substantial excerpt from the Proposed Conditions, marked to show the above changes, is attached.  Please let us know if you have any questions about this matter. 

Yours Sincerely,

_______________________




_________________________

Richard Hetke
Paul K. Mancini

Senior Counsel
General Attorney and

Ameritech Corporation
Assistant General Counsel

SBC Communications Inc.

cc:
Mr. Atkinson


Mr. Krattenmaker


Mr. Wright


Ms. Carey


Mr. Dever


Ms. Mikes


Ms. Atwood


Ms. Bailey


Mr. Dixon


Ms. Kinney


Ms. Whitesell


Ms. Browne 

1
7

