PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2106

Public Law 101-239
101st Congress
[H.R. 3299]

dn At

To provide for reconciliation pursuant to section 5 of the concurrent resolution on the
budget for the fiscal year 1990. -

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled,

S8ECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

f’ﬂ)\é%Act may be cited as the “Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act
° ”

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Title I—Agriculture and related pn;gmms.
:}‘3:110 gl udent loan and pe;m:on 1duciary amendmenta.
itle JII—Regula agency fees.
Title IV—Civil oet:v?ce and postal service programs.
Title V—Veterans programs. :
Title VI—Medicare, medicaid, maternal and child health, and other health provi-

sions.
Title VII—Revenue provisions. .
Title VIII—Human resource and income security grovisiona.
Title IX—Offshore oil pollution compenution fun
Title X—Miscellaneous and technical Social Security Act amendmenta.
Title XI—Miscellaneous.

TITLE I—AGRICULTURE AND RELATED
PROGRAMS

SEC. 1001. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrLE~This title may be cited as the “Agncultural
Reconciliation Act of 1989”,
(b) TasLE oF ConrEnts.~The table of contents is as followsr

8ec. 1001, Short title; table of contenta.

Sec. 1002 ybean, sunflower, and safflower planting program; feed grain acreage
on am.

8ec. 1003. Roduction de 1cxency ents for 1990

Sec. 1004. g:i’ cypayment:.mp

Bec. 1005. onofex;;x;gjmmun rtluexportenhnncementprogﬂmmd

or targeted ex asaistan
Sec.IOO&Pumhamm:tf’memalAMnce Corporatwn-tockbyl“arm Credlt
tutions.

Bec. 1007. ustments in dairy price support program. .

SEC. 1002, BOYBEAN SUNFLOWER, AND SAFFLOWER PLANTING PBO-
. GRAM; FEED GRAIN ACREAGE LIMITATION PROGRAM.

(a) PLANTING OF SOYBEANS, SUNFLOWERS, AND SAFFLOWERS ON

AcreEAGE.—Effective orx;lly for the 1990 crops, subsection

(e) of section 504 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (7 U.S.C. 1464(e)) is

amended to read as follows: "o -

#(e) Notwithstanding any other provision of thm Act—

5619



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 10345TAT’. 2124

TITLE III—-REGULATORY AGENCY FEES

Subtitle A—Federal Communications
‘Commission Fees and Penalties

SEC. 3001. FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION FEES.

. (a) UppaTe o FEE ScHEDULE.—Section 8 of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 168) is amended by adding at the end thereof
the following:

“(g) Until modified pursuant to subsection (b) of this section, the
Schedule of Charges which the Federal Communications Commis-
mo? islhall prescribe pursuant to subsection (a) of this section shall be
as follows:

“SCHEDULE OF CHARGES
- Service Fee amount

PRIVATE RADIO BERVICES

1. Marine Coast Stations
a. New License (per station)
b. Modification of License (per station)
c. Renewal of License (per station)
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extengions)....
e. Asgignments (per station)
f. Transfers of Control (per station)
g uest for Waiver
(i) Routine (per request)
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) .....c....ceseecresrrermess
2. Ship Stations .
a. New Licensse (per application)
b. Modification of License (per application)
¢. Renewal of License (per application)
d. uest for Waiver
(i Routine (per request)
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station).............
8. Operational Fixed Microwave Stations
a. New License (per station) .
b. Modification of License (per station)
¢. Renewal of License (per station)
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensions)....
e. Assignments (per station)
f. Transfers of Control (per station) ...
g uest for Waiver
. (i) Routine (per request)
(1i) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)...........
4. Aviation (Ground Stations)
a. New License (per station) ......
- b. Modification of License (per ltation)
¢. Renewal of License (| F
d. Special Temporary thority (Initlal, Modifications, Extendonn)-.« .
e, Assignments (per stati
- f. Transfers of Control (por station) -
. g uect for W,
i) Routine (per request)..
Gi) Non-Routine (per rule section/per ttation)
5. Aircraft Stations
a.Nchlcann(perappliation) . .-
. b. Modification of License (per Application)...........ccomessusssossessn cesssssssossss
", ¢, Renewal of License (per appllention) : —
R oetins (oo o S
e request) -
(il) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)..........c.cooromm....
6. Land Mobile Radio Smtiom (includmg pecial Emergency and Publk: A
Safety Stations) - ' . '
‘a, New lAconso (por cnll lign\

]
oo

g

P b
o0 =3
;. ;S

S8R

(=]
[

2588 B8

BE 2333 88 85 85 B8 55 sagas
288 83 ST388T 3 323333 33 338 23 238338

7

—

333
=r=-1-

s

a?aléé”?ss

§§
23

&
8

5637



[

b. Modification of License (per call sign)
¢. Renewal of License (per call .iﬁ
d. Specml Temporary Authority (Injtial, Modifications, Extensions)....
Assignments (per station) : ereireianerres
f. 'I‘ranuferu of Control (per call sign)
uest for Waiver
(i) Routine (per request)
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station).........cccuvreesrseoersens
h. Reinstatement (per call léen)
L Specialized Mobile Radio Systems-Base Stations
(i) New Licenso (per call sign)
(ii) Modification of License (per call sign)
(iii) Renewal of License (per call sign)
(iv) Waitmg List (annual charge pe lication)
. W) Speda.! porary Authority (In}zrnl

(vi) Asmgnmonu
(vii) Transfers of(?:x:trol (per call sign)
(viii) uest for Waiver
()] tine (per request)
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)......... s omessssnsiss
(ix) Reinstatements (per call sign)
J. Private Carrier Licenses
(i) New License (per call sign)
(i) Modification of License (per call sign)
(iii) Renewal of License (Xer call sign)
(iv) Specm; Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Exten-
sions
(v) Assignments (per call sign)
(vi) Transfers of Control (per call sign)
(vii) uest for Waiver
(1) tine (per request)
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)
(viii) Reinstatements (per call sign)
7. General Mobile Radio Service
a. New License (per call sign)
b. Modifications of License (per call sign)
¢. Renewal of License (per call sign)
d. uest for Waiver
(i) Routine (per request)
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)...........
e. Special Tempom Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extendom)....
f. Transfer of call sign)
8. Restricted Radio’wlephone Operator Permit .
9. Request for Dupllmte Station License (all 86rvices) ... coeeeciossecesmrss
10, Hearlng pamt.iva. New, and Modifications)

IQUIPHINT APPROVAL SERVICES/ EXPERIMENTAL IADIO

1. Certification e
a. Receivers (except TV and FM receivers)
b. ALl Other Devicea

¢ Modifications and Class II Permissive ChANGES c.ceeereosrermmsssesmesarossss -

~d Request for Confidentiality
2. Type Acceptance

"

X a. All Devices . .
b. Modifications nnd Class II Permisgive Changeam...w

¢. Request for Confidentiality
. Type Approval (all devices)
a. With Testing (!nclud.mﬁm Modifications)
b. Without Testing (inclu or Modifications)
c. Request for Confidentiality
Notlﬁcatixmpm for Subscri TV System
. or Sul phon
a. Request for Confidentiali
. Assignment of Grantee Code for Equipment Identification
. Experimental Radio Se

= e

- New (.;omtrucﬁon Permlt and Station Authorization (per uppuca- -
b. Modlﬂcation to Exlstlng Construction Permit and Station Authori- ...

. zation (per application)
¢. Renewal of Station Authorization (per application)

v

5638

Modifications, Exten- .

BRRS HHL Bas BEE K8& 835 Y8R gg??% SRR &8‘5.33‘3

2322333 2233 388 333 2338 2332 333 2333 I3 223

103 STAT. 2125 PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

Pt et

st pt

Yt s

g ) Lol
33

gz



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103

t or Transfer of Control (per application)... .
8 Tem Authorit{ (per np&ca ON) esremisssmessrmeroreponsssvores
Additional for Applicatio ntaining Uests to With.

hold Informa n From Public Inspection (per application)............
MASS MEDIA SERVICES

d
e
f

1. Commercial TV Stations
t New or Major Change Construction Permits

Minor .
¢ Hearing /Minor Change, Comparative New. or Comparative -
Renewal)

a !
.. ent or Transfer
ng Form ('Form.l 314/815)
(il) Sbort Form (Form 3

g. (New or Modification)
Tempornry Authority (other than to remnin silent or
existing STA to remain silent)
i E‘xtendon of'hme to Construct or Replacement of CP .......ccauvrereermr
. Permit to Deliver to Foreign Broadcast Stations ...
Petition for Rul g for New Community of License......cw..corees

L Ovmoral'xilguil port ( tE'er report)

a. New and quor Change Construction Permit
(i) AM Station
(ii) FM Station

or
(i) AM Station
(if) FM Station

2

[} uﬂnﬁ)&dor/hﬁnor Change, Comparative New, or Oumpantlvo

License
i) AM
FM

(v) AM Remote Control

e. nt or Transfer
. (D%Form (Forms 314/315)
(i) Short Form (Form 816)

iw ew or Modification)
poraryAuthonty (othetthantoremainlﬂentor
extend an existing STA to remain silent)
1. Extension of Timse to Construct or Replacement of CP...cccomevoree.
Permit to Deliver ver Programs to Foreign Broadcast Stations............
Petition g Rul'cmn.kmg for New Community of License or Higher
L Ownership Report report)
&mN l:dorChazCo::trucﬁ Permi
" & Newor on Pe t
b.ucemo

A.ignment or Transfer

e. Spochl Temporary Authonty (other than to remain uﬂant or

extend an existing STA to remain silent)
LTV Tnn.llaton and Stations
. & New or Major Change Construction Permit
b. License

Au&nment or Transfer

e.Specthemporu-yAuthority(otherthnntommnindlentor
extend an existing STA to remain silent).......
Services (Includes Remote Picku J) stations, TV Auxiliary
B ltatiom.Am'aledcaatSTLnn IntercityRelqyltaﬁonl,
. and Low Power Auxﬂhryltatmns)

8 i

i

porary
an existing STA to remain silent)

%;

szxf =8 53

2338

Authorlty (other than to remain silent or.

STAT. 2126

-+ 85.00

3500
" 35.00

Sxf 32 B

2382 o

83 33 33383 33383 38 =3

25 B

S
2 zBhE8 2
SIS

88 333 8888

§Fass

100.00
5639



.103 STAT. 2127 PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC.’ 19,1989

. : ‘. e PN
I - Toos RSP I T

6. FM/TV Boosters =~ _ 4'-”~-'l-\-:“
a, New and MA’OTCth&'O Conltructlon Perm‘h e ; ,425,00
b. License - 85.00

c. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain lﬂent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00

7. International Broadcast Station
a. New Construction Permit and Facﬂluea Change CP... SV -y l ggg:gg

b. License

¢. Assignment or Transfer (per station) - 60.00

d. Renewal ; .. - 95.00

e. Freque Assignment and Coordination (per frequen hour)......... . 85.00
Special Temporary Authority (other than to mmﬁ -
extend an existing STA to remam silent) 100.00

8. Cable Television Service ) h

a. Cable Television Relay Service e
(i) Construction Permit e a .- 155.00
(ii) Assignment or Transfer s . 166.00
(iii) Renewal - 155.00
(iv) Modification - 165.00

(v) Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain eilent or
extend an E:isting STA to iemain silent) 1
b. Cable Special Relief Petition 1
c. 76.12 Registration Statement (per statement) L.
d. Aeronautical Frequency Usage Notifications (per nodoo)..........-—.»..»
e. Aeronautical Frequency Usage Waivers (per waiver)
? N Bmaﬁf}‘o&m Const Permi '

a. Newor r ruction Permit :

@ S::pphcatmn for Authorization to Construct a Direct Bmo.dcut 030‘00

lite

2,
(ii) Issuance of Construction Permit & Launch Authority.......e. 19,710.00
(1ii) Licensa to Operate Satellite. "565.00
b. H (Comparative New, Major/Minor Modifications, or Com-
parative Renewal) 6,760.00
¢. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00

8EEES
38888

COMMON CARRIER SERVICES

LA 0"(Co e N Major/Minor Modifications). o e;'mooo
a. earing mparahw ew or or r cal ; .
b. Development Authority . . . Same charge as regular nut.bority in :
: service unless otherwise indicated .
i ¢. Formal Complaints and Pole Attachment Complaints Fﬂln( Feo.....
2. Domegtic Public Land Mobile Stations (includes Dispatch, Con-
trol & Repeater Stations)
ew o
a. New or Additional Facility (per. transm(tter)
b. gﬁjor Modifications (per transmitter)
In Transmitters (per transmitter) :
d. Major Amendment to a Pending Application (per trnmmitter)........

A-igunant or Tran.nfer
irst Call Sign on Application
(ID Each Additional mﬁm ;
Anicnment (per sign
. g_ Renewal (per call sign) . ;

L. Special h'feem uonA(p:l:od ( d?r\ /per location) -
u ty (per frequency/per ssnprressomess
o(porlry Time to Construct (per npplwnuon)mm..«.a R
Notbo of Comnpletion of Construction (gar application). roserns "

LAuxﬂhryTatSt.atkm(pertranamltter -
Communications Service (per requet'.) erlitere
n.Rainmtement( rap cation) taierairecras’ )
Call igm per call aign) o e
r trnnmutter/per loeuﬁon) KIS
Nadonwido . N

w r
. %Netww:Organber( s . .,,_,,,..;
Network Operator (per rator t; N
{‘r Air-Ground Individual Ln:em:;e (peofem onrr ¥ il "’f_
© (D Initial License Lt
(ii) Renewal of License . AR
©. (itl) Modification of License i termiei’
5640 .

3

B

Y.

.0

réggsggggaé omy .&:'
22 =

222 23 - 3338233332338 38

22

5

?é:.a“'-'a.

.......




. PUBLIC LAW-101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 ©103 STATZ 2128

.8, Cellular Systema (per system) - . o A
* a. New or -Additional thtlu g aes -
. b. Major Modification ’ .
- ¢. Minor Modification —_— v ee
d. Assignment or Transfer (mcludmg partul) feiarereen '
" e. License to Cover Construction . T
(i) Initial License for Wireline Camer ;
(ii) Subsequent License for Wireline Carrier
(iif) License for Nonwireline Carrier
(iv) Fill In License (all carriers)
f. Renewal .
ﬁ lgxtenl:lm'lr‘\ of Time ‘i C:)h?r)iletci Constr&ctx)on . .
pec emporary Au ty (per system )
i. Combining Cellular Geographic Service Areas (per system) ...c.ccunne - )
4. Rural Radio (intludes Central Office, Interoffice, or Relay Facihuea)
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter)
. Modification (per transmitter) .
c. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter)..a.....
d. Mmor Modification (per transmitter)
e. Ass ents or Transfers
(i) First Call Sign on Application
(ii) Each Additional Call Sign
(iii) Partial Assignment (per call sign)
f. Renewal (per call sign) .
g- Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per application)..........
Notice of Completion of Construction (per application)
1. Special Temporary Authority (?er frequency/per location)
LReinstatement (per application
Combining Call Signs (per call sign)
1. Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter)
m. Standby Transmitter (per tranamitter/per location). .
5. Offshore Radlo Service (Mobile, Subscriber, and Central Stations; fees
would also applé to an{iexpanslon of this service into coastal waterl
other than the Gulf of Mexico) .
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter)
b. Major Modifications (per transmitter) -
c. Fill In Transmitters (per transmitter) ;
d. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter)...........
e. Minor Modification (per transmitter)
f. Assignment or er -
(i) Each Additional Call Sign
(ii) Partial Assignment (per eall sign)....
ﬁ Renewal (per call sign)
Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per. npplication)......... .
1. Reinstatement (per application)
. Notice of Completion of Construction (per application)
Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per location)
L. Combining Call Signs (per call sign)
m, Auxdhm Station (per transmitter)
n. Standby mitter (per transmitter/ per locationJ
6. Point-to-Point Microwave and Local Television Radio Servlee k
a. Conditional License (per station) - 166.00
b. M'inj‘or Modification of Conditional License or License Authoriza-.
on (per station) gos 165.00
- ¢ Certification of Completion of Construction (per station). ..
d. Ronevnl (per licensed station) . 155.00
) ment or Transfer o N
(i) rat Station on Application - 55.00
(ii) Each Additional Station : 85.00
f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per ltation) srersrsrersssnssseenseens 155,00
'8 Speclal Temporary Authority or Requeat for Waiver of Prior Con- -

‘BaB%

8888'88'8888'8 2883 8888888§ 83883

sEzazes

aééé

= -
SEK

[y

S PERET:

[y Yy

& KSG&EK-

—

B

2B2TB2BIB33 32338

§§§§aa?a

struction Authorization (per 70.00
1. Multi int Distribution Service (mclregmg multichannel MDS) . ., . -
v Opuao:lditionnl License (per station) .. 155.00
Modification of Conditional License or Licenss Authoriza- ... .

n (per station). . 166.00

" ¢.'Certification of Completion of Construction (per channel)................. . 455.00

*"d. Renewal (per licensed station) . 155 00
&Amlﬁz:ntor'l‘mmfer . ) B TP L

. @ Station on Application sesormsssssreosse vt 85.00

(ii) Each Addltmnal tation N . S e 7 85.00

5641



/103 STAT.. 2129 * "PUBLIC LaW '101-239--DEC. 19,71989

f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per atation). .t ecmmrems

b.g Spocnl ‘Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver ofPrlm' Con-
struction Authorization (per request)
8. ng'ltal -Electronic Message Service : T "
a. Conditional License (per nodal station)
b. Mogéfjcatiox‘l o{ Conditional License or License Authorizatlon (per
- station
' ¢ Certification of Completion of Construction (per nodal station).........
! 'd. Renewal {per licensed nodal ltauon)
e, Ass ent or Transfer
(i) Firet Station on Application
__ (ii) Each Additional Station
f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per station)..............
g Special Temporary Authority or Requeat for Waiver of Prior Con-
struction Authorization (per request)
9 Internauonal Fixed Public Radio (Public and Control Stations) .
‘a. Initial Construction Permit (per station)
b. Assignment or Transfer (per application)
* ¢. Renewal (per license)
d. Modification (per station)

e Extennion of Construction Authorization (per station)...c....ceereue.
pecial Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver (per requeot)...
10 Fixed Satellite it/Receive Earth Stations

a. Initial Application (per station)
b. Modification of Lieenna (per station)
c. ment or T'
(i) First Station on A plication
(ii) Each Additional Station
d. Developmental Station (per station)
¢. Renewal of License (per station)
f. Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction Au-
thorization (per request)
ﬁ Amendment of Application (per station)
Extension of Construction Permit (per station) .........coeemmersrmerseer
11, Small Transmit/Receive Earth Stations (2 meters or less and operat«-
hi;g in the 4/6 GHz frequency band)
Application
b Routine Application (per station)
c. Maodification of License (per station)
ment or Transfer
(i) First Station on Application
__ (ii) Each Additional Station
e. Developmental Station (per station)......
f. Renewal of License (per station)
' g Special Tem t];f«:n-ary Authority or Walvers of Prior Construction
Authorization (per requeat)
h. Amendment of Application (per station)
i. Extenaion of Construction Permit (per station) e muecencenee
12. Receive Only Earth Stations
a. Initial. Applicatlon for Registration
b. Modification of License or Registration (por station)

d. Renewal of Llcenne r dat.ion)

‘e, Amendment of Application (per station) .

f. Extension of Construction Permit (per station) ........c.sseespesmssses
1. \, Wnivam {per request)

rtum'l"ormim.l(VSAT)Systeml ) L

nltul A tion (per system)
- b Madiniaton ot Fonia i
o nt or er m
d. Developmental Station yate
e. Renewal of

of License (per system)

f Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Comt.nx:ﬂou Aw .

f thorization (per request)

Amendmont ‘Application L
g pp! (per system)

on Permit (per system)

14. Mobile Batellito Earth Stations _ e

a. Initial Application of Blanket Authorization ...
b. Initial Application for Individual Earth Station

5642

“110.00
70.00
165.00
155.00
155.00
155.00
55.00
35.00
£5.00
70.00

510.00



. PUBLIC TAW;101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2130

c. Modification of License (per system).... 105.00
ent or Transfer (per lyltem) 1,605.00
e, Deve pmental Station 1,000.00
"f. Renewal of Licamo (pe mm) 105.00
L g Spocinl Temp. ty or Walvarl of Prior Construction 105‘00
. (pef uest) .
h. Amendmantof Applwatlon (per lyatem) 105.00
i. Extension of Construction Permit (per system). 105.00
15. Radio determination Satellite Earth Stations
a. Initial Application of Blanket Authorization 5,630.00
b. Initial Application for Individual Earth Station 1,350.00 -
- . .6 Modification of License (per system) 105.00
“d. Ass ent or Transfer (per system) 1,605.00
e. Developmental Station 1,000.00
f. Renowal of Licenss (per xﬂem) 105.00
§. Spécial Temporary. Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction
Authorization (per request) 106.00
h. -Amendment of Application (per system) 105.00
{i. Extension of Construction Permit (per system) 105.00
16. Spcca Stations .
8. Application for Authority to Construct 2,030.00
b. Application for Authority to Launch & Operate
uf Application 70,000.00
. (i) Roplwqment Satellite 70,000.00
c. ent or Transfer (per satellite) 6,000.00
d. Modification 5,000.00
e. Special Temporary Authority or Waiver of Prior Construction Au-
thorization (per request) §00.00
f. Amendment of Application 1,000.00
g Extension of Construction Permit/Launch Authorization (per re- 500.00
17. Sectlon 214 A lic.tlom
a. Overseas le Construction 9,125.00
b. Cable Landing License
(i) Common Carrier 1,025.00
(i) Non-Common Carrier 10,150.00
c. Domestic Cable Construction . 610.00
ood w%214 Applications 0 glo_%
. n. mporary Authority (all services)..... : 10.
Aﬂmenu or Transfers (all services) 610.00
18. Private Operating Status (per application) ..o reresssossees 610.00 -
19 ﬂhone Equipment R&gistratxon 156.00
"B S FPermimi i 10,00
on Filin ( r ﬂl ; .
21. Accounting and Audi 8 pe mg)
a. Field Audit. : . 62,290.00
_ b. Review of Attest Audit . . 384,000.00
c. Review of Depreciation Updata Study (Single State) w...commsrecricen 20,686.00
- . _ (i) Each Additional Sta : 680.00
‘d. Interpretation of Accounti Rules (per request) ... 2,885.00
e Peti ion for Wuvar (per on) 4,660.00
o _ MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES
1. Intornational Telooommunlmtiom Settlements Administrative Fee for N
Collections (per line item).... 2.00
2 Radio Operator Examinations . . . : ;
.- a..Commercial Radio Operator Examination *85.00
b, Rencwnl of Commercial Radio Operator License, Permlt. or Certif- a5 00
T Dupucato or lacement Commercial Radio Operator License,
2. Ship Permit, or Certrﬂ ~85.00
lnspectionofOOungolng Vessels Under Titlem,PartIIoftho :
Comniunications Act (per inspection) .. 620.00
b.lmpecﬂonof?mengerVeuelsUnderTitlam Partmoftho’ "
- Commmunications Act (per inspection) 320,
s Impectlon of Veesels Under the Great Lakes Agreement (per irk oo
] lpoctlon) ; - 860.00
™ TS S H . ‘ 5643



103 STAT. 2131 * PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 -

Nl -

. d. Inspection of Foreign Vessels Under the Safety of Life -at Sea
7+ (SOLAS) Convention (per immcuon) 540.00
- o. Temporary Waliver for Compulsorily Equipped Vessel.........cco. - 60.00”.
(b) CONFORMING - AMENDMENTS. —Secnon 8 of the Commumcatlons
Act of 1934 is further amended—
* (1) by striking the last sentence of subsectwn (a); '
(2) in subsection (b)1), by striking “April 1, 1987" and ingert-
ing “October 1, 1991”; and
(3) in subsectlon (d)(l)— ‘

(A) by striking out “to the followmg radio services:” and
inserting “(A) to governmental entities and nonprofit enti-
ties licensed in the following radio services:”; and

- (B) by inserting “(B)” after “Emergency Radio, or”.

(c) ErrecTIVE DATE; IMPLEMENTATION.—The amendments made by
this section shall take effect on the date of enactment of this Act,
and the Schedule of Charges required by the amendment made by
subsection (a) of this section shall be implemented not later than 150
days after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 3002. FINES AND PENALTIES UNDER THE COMMUNICATIONS ACT OF
‘1934,

(a) Di1SCRIMINATION AND PREFERENCE BY COMMON CARRIER.—Sec-
tion 202(c) of the Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 202(c)) is
amended—

(1) by striking “$500” and inserting “$6,000"’; and
(2) by striking “$25" and inserting “$300".
{b) FAILURE IN FILING oF SCHEDULE oF CHARGES.—Section 203(e) of

such Act (47 U.S.C. 203(e)) is amended—

(1) by striking “$500” and inserting “$6,000”’; and
(2) by striking “$25” and inserting “$300".

(c) NoncoMPLIANCE WiTH RATE ORDERS.—Section 205(b) of such
éscltz(%o Ig S.C. 205(b)) is amended by striking “$1, 000" and inserting

) NoncoMpLIANCE: WiTH LINE ExTENSION ORDERS.—Section
214(d) of the Act (47 U.S.C. 214(d)) is amended by striking “$100" and
inserting *$1,200".

(e) FAILURE TO FILE REPORTS OR INFORMATION.~—Section 219(b) of
the uAsclt 2(33,U S.C. 219(b)) is amended by striking “$100” and msert-
ing '

() RECORDKEEPING FAILURES.—Section 220(d) of the Act (47 US.C.
22((d)) is amended by striking “$500” and inserting “$6,000”, -

() NONCOMPLIANCE WrTH SHIPBOARD RADIO REQUIREMENTS.
tion 364 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 362) is amended—

_ (é) by stnkmg “$5600” in subsection (a) and inserting “$5,000";

(2) by striking “$100” in subsection (b) and inserting ““$1,000"”. .
(h) - NoNcoMPLIANCE WITH PASSENGER VESSEL Rabio anumx-
MENTS.—Section 386 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 386) is amended=
(;) by striking “$500" in subsection (a) and mserting "$5,000"'
-an
(2) by striking “$100” in subsection (b) and msertmg “$1 000".
(i) GENERAL FORFEITURES.—Subsection :(b) of sectién 503 of the
Communieatxona Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 503(b)) is amended— .
(1) by. inaertmg “(1)" after “(b)” at the begmnmg of such
aubsectxon,
. () by stnkmg paragraph (2) and insertmg the following:
5644



« PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2132

. -*%2XA) If the violator is (i) a broadcast station licensee or permit-
tee, (ii) a cable television operator, or (iii) an applicant for any
broadcast or cable television operator license, permit, certificate, or
other instrument or authorization issued by the Commission, the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this section
shall not exceed $25,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $250,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

*(B) If the violator is a common carrier subject to the provisions of
this Act or an applicant for any common carrier license, permit,
certificate, or other instrument of authorization issued by the
Commmsxon, the amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under
this subsection shall not exceed $100,000 for each violation or each
day of a continuing violation, except that the amount assessed for
any continuing violation shall not exceed a total of $1,000,000 for
any single act or failure to act described in paragraph Q of this
subsection. -

“C) In any case not covered in subparagraph (A) or (B), the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this subsection
shall not exceed $10,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $75,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

“(D) The amount of such forfeiture penalty shall be assessed by
the Commission, or its designee, by written notice. In determining
the amount of such a forfeiture penalty, the Commission or its
designee sghall take into account the nature, circumstances, extent,
and gravity of the violation and, with respect to the violator, the
desree of culpability, any hxstory of prior offensea, ability to pay,

ch other matters as justice may require.’

Subtitle B—NRC User Fees

SEC. 3201. NRC USER FEES.

Section 7601 of the Consolidated Omnibus Budget Reconciliation
Act of 1985 (COBRA) (Publlc Law 99-272) is amended to read as

follows
“(1) IN GENERAL—The Nuclear Regulatory Commission shall
~ assess and collect annual charges from its licensees on a fiscal
- year bas(}:s except that— - . -

the maximum amount of the aggregate charges
" assessed pursuant to this paragraph in any fiscal year may
not exceed an amount that, when added to other amounts
_collected by the Commission for such fiscal year under-
. "other provisions of law, is estimated to be-equal to 33
percent of the costs incurred by the Commission with re-
spect to such fiscal year, except that for fiscal year 1990
- guch maximum amount shall be estimated to be equal to 45
.. percent of the costs mcurred .by the Commission for fiscal
T mn m charge aasesaed this h

. . . (B)any syc ursuant to paragrap
' "shall be reasonably related to the regulatory service pro-
. ... vided by the Commission and shall fairly reflect the cost to

- “the Commission of providing such service.
5645



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 .STAT. 2106

Public Law 101-239
101st Congress
[H.R. 3299]

an At

Topmldoforreeondliauonpunmttooecuonsofdwmcurmtruoluﬁononﬂm
budget for the fiscal year 1990. -

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

f}‘s})‘zlg?) 'A,tct may be cited as the “Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act
o

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Title I—. ture and related p: rolgrnms.
Rgo I®1ll tudent loan and pe?sion 1duciary amendmenta.
e III—Regulatory agency fees.
Title IV—Civil lenx:e and postal service programs.
Title V——Veterans programs. ’
Title VI—Medieu'e, modluid, maternal and child health, and other health pmvi—

Title VH—Revenuo provisions.

Title VIII—Human regsource and income security g_mvhionl.

Title IX—Offshore oil pollution compensation fun

g:llo ;(a—Mweelhnooua and technical Social Security Act a.mendmentn.
e XI—Miscellaneous.

TITLE I—AGRICULTURE AND RELATED
PROGRAMS

SEC. 1601. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHorT TrrLe.—This title may be cited as the “Agricultural
Reconciliation Act of 1989",
(b) TasrLe or ConTEnTs.—The table of contents is as follows

Bec. 1001. Short title; table of contents.
Sec. 1002. Soybean, sunflower, and safflower planting program; feed grain acreage

Sec. 1003. Reduction ts for 1990 crops.

Bec. 1004. ofn.dnncecr:hdencyptymenu.

8ec. 1005, ucuondupendlmmunduthoupoﬂenhnmtmﬂmnnd
or targeted export assistance.

'MIMWMMWWMMMFMM
Sec. 1007. Atliimtmenuindnh-yprbompportpmgnm. -

SEC. 1002, SOYBEAN SUNFLOWER, AND SAFFLOWER PLANT!NG PRO-‘
. GRAM; FEED GRAIN ACREAGE LIMITATION PROGRAM. -

(a)PummaorSonnNs.S AND SAFFLOWERS ON
PrrMITTED ACREAGE.—Effective only for the 1990 crops; subsection
(e) of section 504 of the Agricultumi Act of 1949 au l464(e)) is
amended to read as follows:

“(e) Notwithstandmg any other provimon ofthis Act—

5619



 PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT: - 2124

‘TITLE ITI-REGULATORY AGENCY FEES

Subtitle A—Federal Commun'ié,ajti-(?li’s*
‘Commission Fees and Penalties

SEC. 3001. FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION FEES.

. (a) UrpATE or Fee ScHEDULE.—Section 8 of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 1568) is amended by adding at the end thereof
the following:

‘) Until modified pursuant to subsection (b) of this section, the
Schedule of Charges which the Federal Communications Commis-
sion shall prescribe purauant to subsection (a) of this aectxon shall be
as follows:

“SCHEDULE OF CHARGES
- Service s Fee amount
PRIVATE RADIO SERVICES
1. Marine Coast Stations

a. New License (per station) $70.00
b. Modification of License (per station) -70.00
¢. Renewal of License (per station) 70.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensions).... 100.00
e. Assignments (per station) 70.00
t. Transfers of Control (per station) 85.00
uest for Waiver
(i) Routine (per request) 105.00
(i) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 106.00
2. thp Stations
8. New License (per application) 85.00
b. Modification of [ke.me( r application) 85.00
¢. Renewal of License (per applicauon) 86.00
¢ @i %&WM 105.00
(i) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 1056.00
8. Operational Fixed Microwave 8 uom
a. New License (per station) 155.00
b. Modiﬁcatlon of License (per tlou) 165.00
¢. Renewal of ?&r 166.00
d. Special Tempornry( uot:)ority (Inlt.lal. Modifications, Extensions).... lg%
per stal
£ Transfers of Control (per station) ... 35.00
¢ o v(Iper request) ‘105-.00
" (i) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) . 106.00
4. Aviation (Ground Stations) -
a. New (per station) ...... e 70.00
- b. Modification of License (per station) .70.00
i i Ishnﬂnl of License finn\ o ng%
pecial Temporary ty (Initial, Modifications, Extendom) -.100.
- e. Assignments (per mtion) 70.00
+ " f. Transfers of Control (per station) —~ . 86.00
- ( Rout.ff.;e‘Yper request) ' . ‘30500
" . (i Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) . 105.00
6. Akuﬁdt Stations - ) : s 85.00
‘a. New License application : oo B
-huwmg’iﬁm(mnmuﬁm recormiceens ..+ 35.00
c. Renewal of License (per tion) i . 8600
for Watver - - ) - - sy
[i1)) Non-aoém (per rule soction/per station) 105.00
a. New License (per call sign) . : 85.00



103 STAT. 2125 ' PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19,1989

b. Modification of License (per call sign) L S . 85.00
i lgonawachf License (per eal thL M 85.00
pecial Temporary Authority odifications, Extensions)... . 85.00
| o. Asgignments (per station) 86.00
i f. Transfers of(bnttol(perca.ll sign) 35.00
g for Waiver :
(i) Routine (per 105.00
(i) Non-Routine (por rule lecuon/per station) 105.00
h. Reinstatement lgn. 85.00
1. Specialized Radio Systems-Base Stations
(i) New License call sign). 35.00
(ii) Modification of License (per call sign) - 85.00
?fvu) Wa.iting lo.l‘;t ( ua.l(vgd:‘n.rge gg’gg
W, Spednl porary Autho (Inmd, Modifications, Exten- 85.00
(v-[) Aadgnmon sign) 35.00
'I\'anafenof(%u'ol(pac‘lhm\ 35.00
Mm(l ue:lt fogdr:;wlt 105.00
ne X
(2) Non-Routine (per rule lection/per station) 105.00
(ix) Reinstatements (per call sign) 35.00
J. Private Carrier Licenses
(i) New License (per call sign 35.00
(iD Modification ofl.hem (per call ugn) 86.00 .
iii) Renewal of License call sign 35.00
(iv) Spocia.l Temporary Aathority (Initiul, Modifications, Exten- 95.00
) Amignmentl 36.00
(vi) Transfers ﬂw (per cull sign) 85.00
(vid) for Waiver
1) ine request) . 105.00
(2) Non-Rou rule section/per station) 105.00
(viii) Reinstatements (per call sign) 35.00
7. General Mobile Radio Servico '
a. New License (per call 35.00
b. Modificationa of Lioenn (Per call sign) . 35.00
¢. Renewal of License (per call sign) 85.00
d. est for Waiver . :
(i) Routine (per request) . 105.00
Sp(gc’iﬁoTn.em (p“t.l:h‘;rl}e muﬂumm Extensions) 12? 33
e. Au ( o A
f. Transfer of con:a (per call t’ 86.00
8. Restricted Radiotelephone Opentor Permit ¢ 35,00
9. Request for Duplicate Station License (all services) . 85.00
10. Hearlng (Compamt.lwa. New, and Modifications) . 6,760.00
EQUIPMENT APPROVAL mvm/mnmmtum
L Certification e
;Beoaivon(empt'I’VandFMmeelven) : : . 285,00
b. All Other Devices 785.00
.. & Modifications and Class II Permissive Changes a . cccssecscss -~ 35.00
d. Request for Confidentiality . ive - ;. 105.00
P v - N el 3T0.00
Qb.ModlﬂaﬁomdelmﬂPermhdveChanguw 35.00
for Oonflden .. 106,00
(lncludlziw Modiﬁcat!ons\ -~ 1,465.00
’ Wltbout = .. 171000
Rorruont for Cotilocsialics 105.00
tNoﬁﬂeauom : S . --116.00
Advance Approval for Subscription yetem X . $965.00
- & Request for Oonﬂdoudsli:y . . 105.00

G.Asdxnmentof(}unmCodo orEquipmentMentifhﬁon...._....... . -+ 36.00
', LNewOumtrudonPermltmdShﬁonAutboﬂnﬂon(puappﬂa-;- _ )

tion) -
hmmmwmwwtmmmmm;

nﬂon(pe&:ﬂaﬂou) . - 85.00
5638_0.‘Renevnlot Authorization (per application) c e ecvecere 85.00




PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 :103 STAT. 2126

d. entor'l‘ramfer ofControl(pernp?m ceevea - - 35,00
. f. Addltionll for Ap uomp&nuh:lng aests to With-
hold nFrom lic Inspection (per app (1) NS 35.09
MASS MEDIA m . [RSEIPARIN .
LOmR glvajosuﬁmge(bmtrucﬁ Permit | z,sésoo
. a. Newor r on /| X
hHwing /Minor Change, Comparative N Companﬁvo 55,00
c or ew, or :
Renewal) P 6,760.00
d License 170.00
. ent of Transfer '
(1] Form (Forms 814/315) ~ 565.00
(il)ShortForm (Form 816) 1%88
ﬁ; sp‘gSn(NcworModiﬁauon) 65.00
TempomryAuﬂwﬂty(otharthmtoremdndlentor
existing STA to remain silent) 100.00
GonstmctorRoplacement of CP 200.00
Permit to Dellver to Foreign Broadcast Stations 65.00
PetiﬂonforRul orl;lew Community of License...ces l.Sgg‘g
Report(mm
2 N dquorange(::trucﬁ Permit
a. New an on
(i) AM Stal 2,265.00
ﬂDFMStation _ - 2,030.00
(i) AM Station 666.00
(ii) FM Station 666.00
Rmm/m Change, Comparative New, or Oomptnﬁva
, 6,760.00
(i)AM N $70.00
(it) FM : 116.00
(iii) AM Directional Antenna ' 425.00
(iv) FM Directional Antenna 855.00
(v)AMR:moteOonml 35.00
e or Transf,
i) Form (Forms 814/315) 665.00
i Spegﬁn ew or Modification) : 65.00
\porary Authonty (other than to remain lihnt or .
extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00
1. Extension of Time Onnttruct Replacement of CP £00.00
t by Bulmm‘wp 5500
for New Community ofueenaeorngha "
L Ovwnership Report (per report) - 786.00
&FH';“mnllm (e 2500
- a. New or Major Change Construction Permit
b. License : gg.gg
‘¢ Assignment or Transf : X
d-Bpochl'I‘cmmry:thod (otberthnn temainlﬂant S B
e u
extend an STA gmalnsilenﬁ . or. 100.00
LTV'I}'}'Amhwnmd Sutiom . Co L e
a. Now mmmcommmpm S~ - 425.00
B, License " 8500
A.icnmentor'l‘nnsfor £0.00
Bpodnl Temporary Authority (other than to remain lﬂont or.
mdanedlﬂngs'I‘Ator?nmlnsﬂenﬁ ; 100.00
m Bervices (Includes Remote Pickup stations, TV Antilhry
n. Aéﬂonl 7 stations) oo . 8500
thodnlWAutbbdty(othe’thomfnlﬂm
RIS -3 or
'+ extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00




.103 STAT. 2127 'PUBLIC LAW101-239--DEC:‘ 19,1989

6. FM/TV Boosters - ' IR
;Newandbdqjor(nungecomtmcuonl’emﬂh soesarsssrrmsirie
c.Specthem Authodty{othert}mntoremalnlnentar . :

mcxllﬁng STA to remain silent) 100.00

7. Internationsl Broadcast Station . .
a. New Construction Permit and Fncﬂlt!eaanngeCP Lacies 1,705.00
"1‘;7';;' Transf tion) i -: ':"'"'8?6'88
c ment or er stal . s X
e. nt
f. Special porary Authority (other than reﬂ silent or -

. extend an existing STA tommdnlilen '100.00

8. Cable Television Service )

a. Cable Television Relay Service . .
gﬁ)&:mtmction Permit cresass ievmsssmtainss }?5&%
tor er . . .
mDAsaignmen Transf : : ‘155.00
(iv) Modification 1565.00

(v) Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to iemdn silent) 100.00
b. Cable Special Relief tion 790.00
¢. 76.12 Registration Statement (per statement) . 85.00
e T
e nau ) vers cmerisessresnssrssesias
9. Direct Broadcast miu o8 o

a. New or Major Change Construction Permit
(¢ Aptzllllcation for Authorization to Construct a Direct Bmldeut 2,030.00
(i) Issuance of Construction Permit & Launch Authority. 19,710.00
(iii) License to Operate Satellite 665.00
b. H (Comparative New, Major/Minor Modifications, or Com-
parative Renewal) 6,760.00
¢. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00

COMMON CARRIKR SERVICES

: phlntlnndPoleAttuchmcntOom tlFﬂh(Fu..... 12000
2, Domeaﬁc Public Land Mobile Stations (incl g& Oon-
trol & Repeater Stations)
a New or Additiona! Facility (per transmitter) catessmesnren 230.00
b. Major Modifications (per transmitter) .
¢ Fill In Transmitters (per transmitter)




 PUBLIC 1AW -101-239--DEC. 19,-1989 103 STAT: 2128

&amm&mm S e e
& New or &?rdl-‘adlitiu o~ eremraens .- ‘ N
. b. odification . S

¢ Minor Modiflcation i p—:
L Aadsnmentor'l‘mnsfer(includingparthl) e mreeessosrvestiesavoures: .
"' " @, License to Cover Constru T
: (i) Initial License for Wireline Carrier .
(ii) Subsequent License for Wireline Carrier
(iii) License for Nonwireline Carrier
¢ (iv) Fi'll In License (all carriers)
L W
g- lsixtensiuTme:‘f Time t: Compleu: Constructi)on . .
pecial Temporary Authority (per system e
i. Combining Cellular Geographic Service Areas (per ) P
4. Rural Radio (intludes Central Office, InterofTice, or y Facilities)
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter) .
. b. Modification (per transmitter) .
r Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter) .o,
d. Minor Modification (per transmitter)
livr_xmentl or Trnnsferl
rat Call Sign on Application
(u) Each Additional Call Sign
(iii) Partial Assignment (per call sign)
f. Renewal (per call sign)
g- Extension of Time to Complete Construction a lication).m....
Notice of Completion of Construction (per applica
L. Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per location) in.......
Reinstatement (per :p;:olicat:on?e
Oombinm% Call Signs (per call sign)
L Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter) -
m. Standby Transmitter (per transmitter/per location) .
5. Offshore Radlo Service (Mobile, Subscriber, and Central Stations;.fees
would also npplé {d expansion of this service into coastal wauu
other than the Gulf of Mexico)

‘§a?sés§'§§§§”f

2882 ‘g

—
[=4
[

2RReR

8838233323383 8383 33838333 2383

BEZaE

- a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter) 105.00
b. Modlﬁcutionl (per tranamitter) . 105.00
c. Fi Tranamitters (per transmitter) : 105.00
quor Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter)........  105.00
e. Minor Modifmw tnnsmi tter) 85.00
f. Ass t or
@ Additiona! Call Sign 85.00
(ii) Partial Ansignment (per call sign) ... 105.00
N ﬁ_ Renewal (per call - 85.00
Extension of 'I‘ime to (‘omplete Construction (per. lpplicathn)....... . ..36.00
" L Reinstatement (per application) 86.00 .
tNotice of Completion of Construction (per application)...coocececeeneee. . 35.00
Special Temporary Aut.hcn;ﬁ (per frequency/per location) e 200.00
Call Signs (per - 200.00
nL Auxil Test Station (per tmnsmlttu) . 200.00
Sul.m:[lvgl itter (per tranamitter/ locat.lon) - £00.00
G.PolnHo-Po tMicrowanlndeal'Dal RadioSefvieo .

(per station) - 166.00

b. M:f::Modifmﬁon of Conditional UcamoorUeanuAutborln--
(per station) e 165.00
" ¢ Certification of Completion of Construction (per station) ..1566.00
' . d. Renewal (per licensed station) . 165.00

5 t or Transfer . e s e

) Station on A lk:-ﬁon 65.00
@il) Each Additfonal Station 35.00

f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per mﬁon)........._............ 55,00
f&BManemponryAuthorityorRequatfordeofPrbrOm— o
) struction Authoriza .




.103 STAT. 2129

f.ExtensionofConstrucﬁon Authorization (por station) oo
g.BpeddTempomryAuthoﬂtyorRoqueatforWahordPﬂorCon—
struction Authorization (per request) .
&Digiulmwtmnh: Service

a. Conditional License (per nodal station)
b. Modlﬁcatlo? o{Condniom] License or License Authodudon (pof
nodal station

o ¢. Certification of Completion of Construction (per nodal station)......
' .'_d.Ranewd(perlieamed nodal muon)
Y

or
(o uttShﬁononA iaﬁm

of ‘(per station) e
&. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-

Authorization (per request)

struction
9 Internstional Fixed Public Radio (Public nnd Control Stationa)

A 'c.Renewtherlieenu)

10

11

‘a. Initial Construction Permit (per statio:
b. Assignment or Transfer (per cpplieadon)

r atation)
aionumAuthoRd:uon gperwmﬁon()p.;. m....
rary Aul ty or uest for Waiver requ -
Fixed Satelllto t/Receive Earth Stations
a. Initial Application (per station)
b. Modu'luaon of License (per station)

c ment or Tranafer
Al(?)i?lm Station on Asppliution
(ii) Each Additional Station
d. Developmental Station (per station)
¢, Renewal of License (per station)
f. Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction Au-

thorization (per
. Amendment Apphaﬁon (per station)
on of Construction Permit (per station) .........oeereceescesese
Small 'I‘ransmit/Rwein Earth Stations (2 meters or less and opent-
Loi:s in the 4/6 GHz frequency band)
Application

b. Routine Apphcation {per station)
¢. Modification of Licensa (per station)

d A-i?;:nt or Transf
m Station on Aer lication
(i) Each Additional Station
Developmen

d. Modifica

tion (per req
Amendment of Afgﬂmwm {(per station)

i Permit (per station)

12. Roedvn Only Eu-th Stations

13,

" @, Renewal of License (per system)
£ tbotinﬁon

Extersi d‘ -
14. Hobﬂe&tomu M'Msu o

{

tion for Registration
of License or Registration station)
tot'l‘nmfor (por

LBpoddenryAuthmitqudm:ofPﬂorMAw

Pa'mit(porlyuum)

Application of Blanket Authorization ...
b.inlthlAppliuﬁon forlndlv[dudEaﬂhStathn

5642

'PUBLIC LAW '101-239--DEC. 19,1989

“'110.00 .

S5 BEIZZZ 2 azm
S8 3IIIYS B ===

§§§§

sae
SRR

. [--]
T ;
S B3 23 2=2==

N

680.00
’%,350.00



- PUBLIC LAW:101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2130

c.Modiﬂadonc(Heamo(per i : -~105.00

. d torTnnsfor(pormtem) S . i 1,605.00

v @, pmentnlShtion : - 1,000.00

"f. Renowal of License (per sy 105.00
&WTmmA tyordeofPﬂorOomtrumon B

. Authorization (per req 105.00 -

' b, Amendment of Appliutlon (per tyltem) - 105.00

" {. Extension of Construction Permi lyttem\ 105.00
15. Radio determination Satellite Earth o

a. Initial Application of Blanket Authorlutlon 5,630.00
b. Initial Application for Individual Earth Station 1,350.00
,c.ModﬂhﬂonofUcenn(p:;rmm) légggg
: ent or Transfer system wlo.
. DowA“l%:;)nmental Station 1,000.00
f. Renewal of License (per mm) 1056.00
g. Spécial Temporary Au or Walvers of Prior Construction
Authorlutgo 105.00
h. Amendment of Appll (per 105.00
i Extension of Permit (per system). 105.00
16. Space Buﬂom :
a. Application for Authorl to Construct 2,080.00
b. A&)Umﬁon for Authority to Launch & Operate
tial Application 70,000.00
(ii) Replacement Satellite 70,000.00
ment or Transfer (per satellite) 6,000.00
i g‘pedalm'l‘eug thority or Waiver of Prior Construction A 5.000.00
. X mporary Au or Waiver or on Au-
thorization request) d 500.00
f.Amendment of Application 1,000.00
g. Extension of Const.ruct.lon Permit/Launch Authorization (per re- 500.00
17. Section 214 Applications
y %{!ﬁu Connu-m-ﬂnﬂ . 9,125.00
e Landis ;
Carrm' 1,
(iI) Non-Common Carrier 10,
¢. Domestic Cable Co .

d sAll Other 214 Applixnﬁonl o0 ;
¢. Special Temporary Authori services
- mnu or ers (all services) ...
18. Private rating Status (per application)
19. Talaghone Equipmon Regmtra

ctrerersecere

2% 55222288
3% 333333%s

,a. FM :
b. 8 Perm.luion Filing (per ﬁhng)
2L Accounting and Audits
a. Field Audit. 62,290.00
b, Review of Attest Audito o $4,000.00
c. Raview of Depreciation Update Study (Single State) £0,685.00
-~ () Each Additional State 680.00
d. In on of Accoun Rules (per request) 2,885.00
. Pad 'fo‘r Wuiv’er (per petition) 4,660.00

MIBCELLANEOUS cnulon
1 Intornntioual Telecommunlat!onl Settlemontl Administrative Fee for :

Collections (per line item).... v 2.00
z.RadbOpantorEumlnn - ' S
CommerethsdloOpontorEnmlmﬂon *35.00
b.RonﬂnlofCommerdd Operltorucenle.l’e:mlt.orw 8500
ic.Duplicatoor lacementCommercthadnoOpeuhorUcenn. S
2. i Permit, or ‘35.00
P Inepections. e
n.lmm Omﬂg&nquuellUndcr'I‘lﬂcm.Putndtho o
Commiunications Act (porwﬁ“ 620.00
b.Imped.lonqof:PumehU ‘I‘itlem,Pnrtmdtbo' S
‘wmav«eﬁdéﬁru Great Lakes Agreement (per-in- -~ 22000
[ rea 2

ARIWER L Bhe meslEoSe b o ’ 5643
! . g . . J ‘



R

103 STAT. 2131 ' PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 -

d.InspectionofForeignVeuahU Saf Life ‘at Sea )
DA Convention (oos poctiogy, oo Sefety of 540.00
- @, Temporary Waiver for Com Equipped Vmel.................... - 60.00",
(b) CONFORMING" Amnmm—Secﬁon 8 of the Commumcations
Act of 1984 is further amended—
(1) by striking the last sentence of subsectlon (@;
(2) in subsection (bX1), by striking “April 1, 1987” and insert-
ing “October 1, 1991”; and
(3) in subaectlon (Xm)-— '

(A) by striking out “to the followmg radio services:” and
inserting “(A) to governmental entities and nonprofit enti-
ties licensed in the following radio services:"; and

(B) by inserting “(B)” after “Emergency Radlo, or’”.

(© EFFECTIVE DATE; IMPLEMENTATION.—The amendments made by
thig section shall take effect on the date of enactment of this Act,
and the Schedule of Charges required by the amendment made by
subsection (a) of this section shall be implemented not later than 150
days after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 3002. FINES AND PENALT!ES UNDER THE COMMUNICATIONS ACT OF
‘1934,

(a) DisCRIMINATION AND PREFERENCE BY COMMON CARRIER.—Sec-
tion 202(c) of the Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 202(c)) is
a.mended—

(1) by striking “$500"” and inserting “$6,000"; and
(2) by striking “$25" and inserting “$300".

{b) FAILURE IN FiLING oF SCHEDULE oF CHARGES.—Section 203(e) of
such Act (47 U.S.C. 203(e)) is amended—

(1) by striking ““$500" and inserting “$6,000”; and
(2) by striking “$25" and inserting “$300".

(c) NoncoMPLIANCE WrTH RATE ORDERS.—Section - 205(b) of such
9;{:2(‘&7)0 l{ S.C. 205(b)) is amended by striking “$1,000” and inserting
@ NONCOMPLIANCE: Wit LiNe ExTensioN ORrbErs.—Section
214(d) of the Act (47 U.S.C. 214(d)) is amended by striking “$100"” and

inserting “$1,200".

(e) quns 10 FiLE RErORTS OR INFORMATION.—Section 21%(b) of
?he A$(it ,2%3 U.S.C. 219(b)) is amended by striking “$100” and msert-

ng 44 7”

® RECORDKEEPING Fuwans -—Sectnon 220(d) of the Act (47 US.C.
22((d)) is amended by “$500” and inserting “$6,000". -

(8) NoONCcOMPLIANCE WITH SHIPBOARD RADIO REQUIREMENTS.
tion 864 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 362) is amended—

(1) by stnkmg “$500” in subsection (a) and inserting “$5,000";

(2) by striking “$100” in subsection (b) and inserting “$1,000". .

(h) -NoNcoOMPLIANCE WITH PaASSENGER  VESSEL Rapio anumn-
MENTS.—Section 886 of such Act (47 U.8.C. 386) is amended=

(;) by striking “$500" in subsection (a) and inserting “35.000"

(2) by striking “$100” in subsection (b) and “$1 000".
(i) GeNERAL ForrErrures.—Subsection .(b) of section of t.he
Communicat.ions Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 503(b)) is amended— - -
(1) by.inserting “(1)” after “(b)" at’ the beglnning of auch
subsection, and -
{2) by striking paragraph (2) and inserting the following:

5'644



« .PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2132

-4(2XA) If the violator is (i) a broadcast station licensee or permit-
tee, (ii). a cable television operator, or (iii) an applicant for any

broadcast or cable television operator license, permit, certificate, or
other instrument or authorization issued by the Commission, the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this section
shall not exceed $25,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any c¢ontinuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $250,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

*“(B) If the violator is a common carrier subject to the provisions of
this Act or an applicant for any common carrier license, rm:t,
certificate, or other instrument of authorization issued ge
Commission, the amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under
this subsection shall not exceed $100,000 for each violation or each
day of a continuing violation, except that the amount assessed for
any continuing violation shall not exceed a total of $1,000,000 for

single act or failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this
auéectnon.

*“(C) In any case not covered in subparagraph (A) or (B), the -
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this subsection
shall not exceed $10,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $75,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

‘(D) The amount of such forfeiture penalty shall be assessed by
the Commission, or its designee, by written notice. In determining
the amount of such a forfeiture penalty, the Commission or its
designee shall take into account the nature, circumstances, extent,
and gravity of the violation and, with respect to the violator, the
degree of culpability, any hmtory of prior offensea, ability to pay,
and such ot.her matters as justice may require.’

Subtltle B—NRC User Fees

SEC. 3201. NRC USER FEES.

Section 7601 of the Consolidated Omnibus Budget Reconciliation
ﬁlt of 1985 (COBRA) (Public Law 99-272) is amended to read as

ollows:
“(1) IN GENERAL—The Nuclear Regulatory Commission ghall
" assess and collect annual charges from its licensees on a fiscal

- year ba%except that— - . -

the maximum amount of the agg’regate charges
" assessed pursuant to this pa ph in any fiscal year may
not exceed an amount that, when added to other amounts
~ collected by the Commission for such fiscal year under-
. "other provisions of law, is estimated to be- equal to 33
percent of the costs incurred by the Commission with re-
spect to such -fiscal yearh;olxlcept that for fiscal year 1930

- guch. maximum amount s beeahmatedtobeequalto45
: ,pereelngtggf thg costs mcurred by the Commissxon for fiscal

, “(B) any such charge assessed ursuanttothmparagraph

* ‘shall be .reasonably related to 81 .eervice pro-
. vided by the Commission and shall fairly reflect the cost to
" the Cominission of providing such service. 5645



