
PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

Public Law 101-239
101st Congress
[H.R. 3299]

- ln crt
To provide for reconciliation pursuant to section 5 of the concurrent resolution on the

budget for the fiscal year 1990.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the "Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act
of 1989".
SEC. Z TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Title I-Agriculture and related programs
Title II-Student loan and pension fiduciary amendments.
Title mI-ReSulato 7 agency fees.
Title rV-ivil servce and postal service programs.
Title V-Veterans programs.
Title VI-Medicare, medicaid maternal and child health, and other health provi.

sions.
Title VII-Revenue provisions.
Title VIII-Human resource and income security provisions.
Title IX--Offshor oil pollution compensation fund.
Title X-Miecellaneous and technical Social Security Act amendments
Title XI--Lscellaneous.

TITLE I-AGRICULTURE AND RELATED
PROGRAMS

SEC 1001. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrITL-This title may be cited as the "Agricultural
Reconciliation Act of 1989".

(b) TABLE or CoNTNrs.-The table of contents is as follows:
Sec. 1001. Short title; table of contents
Sec. 1002 8oybean, sunflower, and safflower planting program feed grain acreage

hmltation program.
Sec. 1003. Reduction of defiiency paymento for 1990 crop.
Sec 1004. Repayment of advance defiency payments.
Sec. 1005 Reduction of expenditures under the export enhancement program and

for targeted export assistance.
Sec. 1006. Purchases of Flnancial Aatance Corporation tock by Farm Credlt

System intlitutions.
8ec. 1007. AdJustments in dairy price support program.

SEC 100t SOYBEAN. SUNFLOWER, AND SAFFLOWER PLANTING PRO.
. GRAM; FEED GRAIN ACREAGE LIMITATION PROGRAM.

(a) PLANTING or SOYBEANS, SUNFLOWERS, AND SAILOWB8 ON
Pemwrrwm AcRGEAL-Effective only for the 1990 crops, subsection
(e) of section 504 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (7 US.C. 1464(e)) is
amended to read as follows:

"(e) Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act-

5619

103 STAT. 2106



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

TITLE III-REGULATORY AGENCY FEES

Subtitle A-Federal Communications
Commission Fees and Penalties

SEC. 8001. FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION FEES.

(a) UPDATE OF FEE SCHEDULL-Section 8 of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 US.C. 168) is amended by adding at the end thereof
the following.

"(g) Until modified pursuant to subsection (b) of this section, the
Schedule of Charges which the Federal Communications Commis-
sion shall prescribe pursuant to subsection (a) of this section shall be
as follows:

"SCHEDULE OF CHARGES
Service Fee amount

PRIVATs RADIO 8ERVIC]S

1. Marine Coast Stations
a. New License (per station) ...... $.... .70.00
b. Modification of License (per station) 70.00
c. Renewal of License (per station) .............. .... .....-.----. 70.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensions)_.. 100.00
e. Assignments (per station)............ ...... .. 70.00
f Transfers of Control (per station) ...... ... .... 35.00
g. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request)....-...-.. 105.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)_. __ .__ 105.00

2. Ship Stations
a. New License (per applicaton)................... 85.00
b. Modification of License (per application). .....--- ... 85.00
c. Renewal of License (per application) . .. 35.00
d. Requeet for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request) . . ._ _ 105.00
(il) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station). .. 105.00

8. Operational Fixed Microwave Stations
a New License (per station)... ._ _ 1565.00
b. Modification.of License (per station) 155.00
c. Renewal of License (per station)...... ............................. 165.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial Modifications, Extensions). 35.00
e. Asrgnments (per station) .. 155.00
£ Transfers of Control (per station) ,. 35.00
g. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per requesft)_ 105.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per' station) . 105.00

4. Aviation (Ground Stations)
a. New License (per station) . 70.00

. b. Modification of License (per station) ______ 70.00
c. Renewal of License (per station)........ ... 70.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensions).. .100.00
e. Assignmenta (per station) .- . 70.00
f. Transfers of Control (per station) " ,85.00,
g. Request for Waiver

.- (Routine (per request) 106.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

& Aircraft Stations
a. New icense (per applcation) 85.00
b. Modification of Llicense (per application) ........ '85.00'
C. Renewal of License (per application) . 35600
d. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request) _ - 106.00
(Ii Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) . .............. 105.00

6. Land Mobile Radio Stations (including Special Emergency and Public
Safety Stations)
a. New License (per call gn)........................... ... ' ' .00

5637

103 STAT'. 2124



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

b..Modification of License (per cali sign) 85.00
c. Renewal of License (per call sign) 85.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensionh- 85.00
e. Assignments (per station) 8. 00
L Transfers of Control (per call sign) n _ 35.00
g. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request) _ 105.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station)... _ 105.00

h. Reinstatement (per call rin)8... 3&00
L Specialized Mobile Radio Systems-Base Stations

(i) New License (per call sign) ........ 85.00
(ii) Modification of License (per call sign) 85.00
(lii) Renewal of License (per call sign). 85.00
(iv) Waiting List (annual charge per pplication) . 85.00
(v) Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Exten-

sions) ............... .. . 8&00
(vi) Assignments (per call sign)...... 85.00
(vii) Transers of Control (per call sgn).... . 85.00
(viii) Request for Waiver

(1) Routine (per request)_ .... 105.00
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) ... 105.00

(ix) Reinstatements (per call sign) ............ 35.00
J. Private Carrier Licenses

(i) New License (per call sign) ......... 85.00
(ii) Modification of License (per call sign) _ . . . 85.00
(iii) Renewal of License (per call sign) ....... .. 5.00
(iv) Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modification, Exten-

sions) - -- _ 85.00
(v) Assignments (per call sign) ..... 5..... _____ .00
(vi) Transfers of Control (per call sign)...._. 85.00
(vii) Request for Waiver

(1) Routine (per request) .. _. ......... _ 106.00
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

(viii) Reinstatementa (per call sign).. ._. 85.00
7. General Mobile Radio Service

a. New License (per call sign) .... ........ ..... . 85.00
h Modifications of License (per call sign)...... 85.00
c. Renewal of License (per call sign). ...... 85.00
d. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request)_ .. _ _. 105.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

e. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modifications, Extensons) 85.00
L Transfer of control (per call sign) ...... 800

8. Restricted Radiotelephone Operator Permit. .. -, 5.00
9. Request for Duplicate Station License (all services) 86.00
10. Hearing (Comparative, New. and Modifications). 6,760.00

qnunmr APptovAL RmwVICs/rxPzRIrwTAL RAmO

L Certification
a. Receivers (except TV and FM receivers) 285.00
bh All Other Devices ................. 78500
c. Modifications and Class II Permissive Changes - 3800
d. Request for Confidentiality........... 1000

2 Type Acceptance
a. Al Devices ..= -. 870.00
.h Modifications and Class II Permissive Changes ._ .. 800
e. Request for Confidentiality . 10.00

8. Type Approval (all devices)
.a With Testing (including Major Modifications). 1,465.00
b. Without Testing (induding finor Modifications) - 170.00
c. Request for Confidentiality r -- 105.00

4. Notificationr ....... 116.00
5. Advance Approval for Subscription TV System 2,5,--.00

a. Request for Confidentiality ..... .. . . 105.00
6. Assignment of Grantee Code for Equipment Identification - 865.00
7. Experimental Radio Servce. .

a. New Constrution Permit and Station Authorization (per appl
'tiUon)_ __ 8.&00'.

b. Modification to Existing Construction Permit and Station Authori- .
, ation (per application) ....... 00

C. Renewal of Station Authorization (per application) .. 85.00
5638

103 STAT. 2125



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

d. Assienment or Transfer of Control (per application)...
e. Special Temporary Authority (per application) .
f. Additional Charge for Applications Containing Request to With-

hold Informaton From Public Inspection (per applicaonn).
*MA -)MA IDL uVicS

8 - 5.00
-'- 85.00

3 5.00

1. Commercial TV Stations
a New or Major Change Construction Permits... ... 2,35.00
b. Minor Change 5. . 65.00
e. Hearing (M or/Minor Chnge, Comparative New, or Comparative

_Renewal- 6,760.00
d. cen ........................................ 170.00
a. Assignment or Transfer

(i) Long Form (Forms 314/16) . ........ 565.00
(ii) Short Form (Form 8166) 80.00

f. Reea!l__ -... 100.00
. Call Sign (New or Modification) 55.00

Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain lent ....... 100.00

L Extension of Time to Construct or Replacement of CP................. 200.00
J. Permit to Deliver Programs to Foreign Broadcast Stations . _ 65.00
k. Petion for Rulemaking for New Community of License..... 1,565.00
L Ownershio Report (per report)...-.-- .---- _ 85.00

2. CommercIal IRadlo Stations
a New and Major Change Construction Permit

(i) AM Station. .. 2255.00
(i F M tation .............. 2,030.00

b. Minor Change
(i) AM Station. o- 65.00
(i) FM Statio n._. 565.00

. He (MaJor/Minor Change, Comparative New, or Comparative
Renew e . ...... 6,760.00

d. Ioense
(I) AM _ 370.00
(if) FM. . _ _ . _ 115.00
(lD) AM Directional Antenna... 425.00
(iv) FM Directional Antenna .. .. 86.00
(v) AM Remote Control ........... 85.00

a. Assignment or Transfer
(I) Laog Form (Forms 814/315) 565.00
(ii) Short Form (Form 816) - __ _ _ 80.00

flR nt , .I.... 100.00
_Call SignwNeor Modification) .6 00
h pecwi Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing 8TA to remain silent) . 100.00

L Extens of Time to Construct or Replacement of CP... 200.00
Permit to Deliver Programs to Foreign Broadcast Stationsr _ 65.00

. Petition for Rulemnlg for New Community of License or Highe
Cl asm C nn ,656.00

L Ownership Report (per report) '_ 8600
FM Translatorn

a. New or Major Change Construction Permit _ 425.00
b.e L cense 86.00
.C Assignment or I ransfer _... 80.00
;. e sma, 8pecO1 Tempor Auboiy ohe hz t eran lnto 3586.00

Special Tempary Authority (other than to remnain silent or
extend an elsting 8TA to remain silent). . _- 100.00

4 TV Transltom and LPTV Stations
a. New or Major Change Construction Permit... 426.00
b.Icense .. .85.00
ac Assignment or Transfer.................. 80.00
Ld Re nenewal_ _ . _- 86.00
e.. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain sent or

extend an existing SA to remain silent). : ' 100.00
&Auxllary Servi (Includes Remote Pickup stations, TV Auxillary

Broadcast stations, Aural Broadcast STL and Intercity Relay stations,
and Low Pori Auxiliary stations)

a. Major _t_, " . 85.00
b. Renerals - 85.00

... Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent) - 100.00

5639

10.3 STAT. 2126



PUBLIC LAWw 01-239--DEt. 7 19f;,r1989

&FM/TV Boosters :
a. New and Major Change Construction Permits ........ ' 42600
b ._..... Lkeae _ .. . ..r }-: 86.00
c. Special Temporary Authority (other than to, remain'silent or

extend an existing STA to remain silent) . . ._.._ 100.00
7. International Broadcast Station

a. New Construction Permit and Facilitiea Change CP_.:_7_ 1,705.00
b. License ._ ._ ._. ..... S85.00
c. Assignment or Transfer (per station) _ 60.00
d. Renewal.._ ... ....-... - '. 96.00
e. Frequency Assignment and Coordination (per frequency hour) . 5.00
f. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent' or

extend an existing STA to remain ilent) '100.00
8. Cable Television Service

a. Cable Television Relay Service
(i) Construction Permit_' 165.00
(ii) Assignment or Transfer............. 1665.00
(iii)U Renewal l....... 155.00
(iv) Modification .......... 165.00
(v) Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or

extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00
b. Cable Special Relief Petition..__..... 790.00
c. 76.12 Registration Statement (per statement). .- 85.00
d. Aeronautical Frequency Usage Notifications (per notice).. 85.00
e. Aeronautical Frequency Usage Waivers (per waiver) 85.00

9. Direct Broadcast Satellite
a. New or Major Change Construction Permit

(i) Application for Authorization to Construct a Direct Broadcast
Satellite ... .... , ,,,.......... 2,030.00

(ii) Issuance of Construction Permit & Launch Authority_ _ 19,710.00
(lii) License to Operate Satellite...... 56... . 665.00

b. Hearing (Comparative New, Major/Minor Modifications, or Com-
parative Renewal)............ ......... 6,760.00

. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent). 100.00

COMMON CQXI:R 'RVX

1. All Common Carrier Services . -:
a. Hearing (Comparative New or Major/Minor Modifications) .:_- 6,760.00
b. Development Authority ... Same charge a regular authority in

service unless otherwise indicated . .
c. Formal Complaints and Pole Attachment Complaints Filing Fee... 12000

2. Domestic Public Land Mobile Stations (includes Bas, Dispatch, Con
trol & Repeater Stations)
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter) 230.00
b. MaJor Modifications (per transmitter) - 230.00
c. Fill In Tranmitters (per transmitter) .... - 230.00
d. Major Amendment to a Pending Application (per transmitter) :--- 230.00
. Aignment or Transfer

First Cal Si on A plic ation __ : 0.00
(ii) Each Addional Call Sign_ 3... &00

f. Partial Assignment (per call sign)...... - 280.00
gRenewa (per call a2dgn)_ ... . 86.00
. Minor Modification (per transmitter). .. '00

L Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per location) ......... ' 200.00
Extendon of Time to Construct (per application) ' -. 300

. Notice of Completion of Construction (per application)- -' 85.00
L Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter) 200.00
m. Subsidiary Communications Service (per request) 100.00
n. Reinstatement (per application)_.. ...... -: 5.00
a. Combining Call Signs (per call ig n)........... 200.00
p. Standby Tranmitter (per transmitter/per location) 200.00
q. 900 MHs Nationwide Paging

WRenewal
(1) Network Organiser .. ............... '5.00
(2) Network Operator (per operator/per city) t ' ' 3500

r. Ar.-iround Individuai License (per station)
' (L) Initali License .5,'_"'; SC.00
(li) Renewal of License .. l OO.....
(idl) Modiation of License :' ;- 85.00

5640

,103 STAT. 2127



;PUBLIC LAW-101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

3.,Cellular Systems (per system)
a. New or Additional Facilities . ": '. 230.00
b. Major Modification. ............ . 230.00
c. Minor Modification ... ? 60.00
d. Assignment or Transfer (including partial)aD ' 230.00
e. License to Cover Construction

(i) Initial License for Wireline Carrier.. ... _......... ._ 595.00
(ii) Subsequent License for Wireline Carrier.-_. .__.. 60.00
(iii) License for Nonwireline Carrier .......................... 60.00
(iv) Fill In License (all carriers) . .. ......... 60.00

f. Renewal ....... 5.00
Extension of Time to Complete Construction ........ ,.... 35.00

h Special Temporary Authority (per system) .....- - ... 200.00
L Combining Cellular Geographic Service Areas (per system)._ .... 50.00

4. Rural Radio (includes Central Office, Interoffice, or Relay Facilities)
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter) .. 105.00
b. Major Modification (per transmitter) ... _..---- ..... 105.00
c. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter)-. 105.00
d. Minor Modification (per transmitter).-._ 835.00
e. Assignments or Transfers

(i) First Call Sign on Application. .... _. ._. 105.00
(ii) Each Additional Call Sign _ ..... 35.00
(iii) Partial Assignment (per call sign).. 105.00

f. Renewal (per call sign) .................... 35.00
Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per application) ... 35.00
Notice of Completion of Construction (per application) 35.00

L Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per location) 200.00
i. Reinstatement (per application) .... _.....3.... . .00
L Combining Call Signs (per call sign)....-.. - -.-. 200.00
L Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter) ............ 200.00
m. Standby Transmitter (per transmitter/per location). . 200.00

5. Offshore Radio Service (Mobile, Subscriber, and Central Stations; fees
would also apply to any expansion of this service into coastal waters
other than the Gulf of Mexico)
a. New or Additional Facility (per transmitter)............... 105.00
b. Major Modifications (per transmitter) __._..__.. ___ 105.00
c. Fill In Transmitters (per transmitter)..... .. . 105.00
d. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter)...... 105.00
e. Minor Modification (per transmitter)... _ _ 835.00
f. Assignment or Transfer

(i) Each Additional Call Sign . 835.00
(ii) Partial Assignment (per call sign). '.. 105.00

g Renewal (per call sign) 5........______... ___ 86.00
h Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per application) _ .835.00
L Reinstatement (per application)-. ...... 35.00
j.Notice of Completion of Construction (per application) ....... 35.00
L Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per location) 200.00
L Combining Call Signs (per call sign)-........ 200.00
a. Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter).. ...... ......................200.00
n. Standby Transmitter (per transmitter/ per location). . 200.00

6 Point-to-Point Microwave and ocal Television Radio Service
a. Conditional License (per station)..._ ...... . 156-00
b. Major Modification of Conditional License or License Authoriza-.

tion (per station). - -........ ........ 155.00
c. Certification of Completion of Construction (per station) ..... 15.00
d. Renewal (per licensed station).. _____ 15&00
e. Assignment or Transfer

(i) First Station on Application ........ 65.00
(il) Each Additional Station .. _____ . .. 8.00

f Extension of Construction Authorization (per station).............. 55.00
g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-

struction Authorization (per request) ............ - 70.00
7.'Multipoint Distribution Service (including multichannel MDS)

aL Conditional License (per station). ... .. ........ 100
b. Major Modification of Conditional License or License Authoria- .: .

tion (per station)......-... . ... ... ....... . 155.00
c. Certification of Completion of Construction (per channel) · ; 455.00
dRenewal (per licensed station) _._ ' 155.00
e. Assignment or Transfer . :

(i) First Station on Application ..... : '.00
(i) Each Additional Station : 3...... · : 85.00

5641

U03 'STATT,.2128



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per station). . ..._ 110.00
'g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-

truction Authorization (per request) 70.00
8. Digital Electronic Message Service

a Conditional License (per nodal station)_..._ ..-.... 155.00
b. Modification of Conditional License or License Authorization (per

nodal station)........ _...... _ 165.00
c. Certification of Completion of Construction (per nodal station)........ 155.00
C d Renewal (per licensed nodal station)_.. 155.00
e. Assigunent or Transfer

(i) First Shtion on Application__ 55.00
(ii) Each Additional Station .. 35....__ 5.00

f. Extension of Construction Authorization (per station) ....... 55.00
g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-

struction Authorization (per request)_.. ......... 70.00
9.' International Fixed Public Radio (Public -and Control Stations)

a Initial Construction Permit (per station) ..... . 510.00
b. Assignment or Transfer (per application) .---. _............ 510.00
c. Renewal (per license) ... 3.. ._ ...... S70.00
d. Modification (per station)... ........... . ... 870.00
a. Extension of Construction Authorization (per station)........_ 185.00
f. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver (per request). 185.00

10. Fixed Satellite Transmit/Receive Earth Stations
a. Initial Application (per station) . _......_..... 1,625.00
b. Modification of License (per station) 105.00
c. Assignment or Transfer

(i) Firs Station on Aplication.... .... 300.00
(ii) Each Additional Station ....... . 100.00

d. Developmental Station (per station)_ ... 1,000.00
ae. Renewal of License (per station) ._. ..... ..--....... 105.00
f Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction Au-

thorization (per request)__ 05... ... 105.00
g. Amendment of Application (per station) 105.00
h. Extension of Construction Permit (per station) ... __..___... 105.00

1L Small Transmit/Receive Earth Stations (2 meters or less and operat-
ing in the 4/6 GHz frequency band)

a. Lead Application .... . ............. " 8, 0.00
b. Routine Application (per station ) ._ .85.00
c. Modification of License (per station).. . .. 106.00
d. Assignment or Transfer

(I) First Station on Application __ 800.00
(i) Each Additional Station -... 85.00

e. Developmental Station (per station).-_ _ -. 1,000.00
f. Renewal of License (per station) .. ,__... . ........ 105.00
g. Special Temlorary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction

Authorization (per requed t)...-...__. 105.00
h Amendment of Application (per station)_. -.... 105.00
i Extension of Construction Permit (per station) .... .' 105.00

12 Receive Only Earth Stations
a. Initial. Application for Registration 2.0.00
b. Modification of License or Registration (per station) 10&00
' c. Assignment or Transfer

(i) First Station on Applic tion ....... .. 00.00
(iD Each Additional Station . .... 100.00

d. Renewal of Licenae (per station) ____ 1000
e. Amendment of Application (per station) . 105.00
f. Extension of Construction Permit (per station) ..... _ _ 105.00
6 Waivers (per request) .... 105.00

13 Very Smll Aperture Terminal (VSAT) Systems .,
a. Initial Application (per system).............. 5,60...00
b. Modificaton of License (per system) 1056.00
c Assignment or Transfer of System ............ 1 00
d. Developmental Station_ __. ............. 1,000.00
a. Renewal of License (per system) .................. .. 105.00
f. Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction Au,

thorization (per request)................. ...... · .105.00
g. Amendment of Appliction (per sytem)s ,. 105.00

Extension of Construction Permit (per system) 105.00
14. Mobile Satellite Earth Stations

a. Initial Application of Blanket Authorization -- ,630.00
h- Initial Application for Individual Earth Station .... 1,50.00

5642

103 STAT.· 2129



:;.PUBLIC IAW;lOl1-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2130

c. Modification of License (per system) 105.00
:. d. Asienment or Transfer (per lyste m)m). . 1,505.00
, .Developnenial Station. _ 1,000.00
.£ Renewal of Lcense (per sstem) 105.00
· 'g..Spedcil Tirnm Authority or Waiver. of Prior Construction

:. Authoriation (per request) .. .. 105.00
h. Amendment of Application (per system) - ...- 105.00
L Extension of Construction Permit (per system) ...... 105.00

15. Radio determination Satellite Earth Stations
a. Initial Application of Blanket Authorization ........... 5,630.00
b. Initial Application for Individual Earth Station. . ......... 1,350.00
c. Modification of License (per sy stem))__..... 105.00
d. Asiguent or Transfer (per yste m). .. .... 1,505.00
e. Developmental Station .... ..... _ ........ _ 1,000.00
£ Renewal of License (per system) ................. 105.00
g. Sp6cial Temporary, Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction

Authorisation (per request ........ 105.00
h. Amendment of Application (per system)._. _. _ 105.00
L Extension of Construction Permit (per system)--._ .--..-- 105.00

16. Space Stations
a Application for Authority to Construct ___.____._ 2,030.00
b. Application for Authority to Launch & Operate

(I) Initial Application.. . . .._..-.--._ ._ 70,000.00
- . (ii) Replacement Satellite . ...--. . ... 70,000.00

c. Aignment or Transfer (per satellite)..... 5000.00
d. Modificatio_ ...... 5,000.00
e. Special Temporary Authority or Waiver of Prior Construction Au-

thorisation (per request) ........ 50.00
L Amendment of Application _._. .. _..... 1,000.00
g. Extension of Construction Permit/Launch Authorization (per re-

quest) 5 00.00
17. Section 214 Applications

a. Overseas Cable Constructon..... ' 9,125.00
b Cable Landing License

(i) Common Carrier ................ 1,025.00
(i) Non-Common Carrier. ..__ _ _ 10,150.00

c. Domestic Cable Constructior .. 610.00
d. All Other 214 Applications .................... ... 610.00
e Special Temporary Authority (all services)..._ . _._ . 610.00
f. Aidgnments or Transfers (all services) . . 610.00

18. Recognized Private Operating Status (per application) ........ 610.00
19. Telephone Equipment Registration_ _ .... 155.00
20. Tariff Filings

; '.a Filing Fee. ....... .......... 490.00
; Special Permission Filing (per filing) ................ 490.00

2L Accounting and Audits
a. Field Audit . _.... __. .__.__ 62,290.00
b. Review of Attest Audit=...... .... . ...... ... 34,000.00
c. Review of Depreciation Update Study (Single State) . 20,685.00

W Each Additional State 6.... .. .... _ _. 680.00
d. Interpretation of Accounting Rules (per request) ... 2,885.00
ae. Petition for Waiver (per petition) ._..... .... 4,660.00

M. U .N.U. CHARO .

1. International Telecommunications Settlements Admrnlstrative Fee for
Collections (per line item)..............._ 2.00

2 Radio Opeirator Examinitlons
a.Commercial Radio Operator Examinatfon *_. . .5.00
b. Renew'al of Commercial Radio Operator License, Permit or Certif-

icate-__..i_: 85.00
:"c Duplicate or Replacement Commercial Radio Operator License

Permit or Certificate ...... 85.00

a. Insp·ecin of Oc ijldng Vessels Under Title m, Part ni of the
Comn C iunlcations Act (per inspection) 620.00

b Inspection of Pasenger Vessels Under Title HI, Part m of the
.Co mmunic tions Act (per inspection) _ 320.00

c. nspecton of Veseel Under the Great Lakes Agreement (per in-
=petton). 860.00

j::?';::~; ·:".~' ~' '; '" - " 5643



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

d. Inspection of Foreign Vessels Under the Safety of Life 'at Sea
(SOLAS) Convention (per inspection) ... .. 540.00

e. Temporary Waiver for Compulsorily Equipped Vessel.... 60.00"'.
(b) CONFORMINo AMENDMNns.-Section 8 of the Communications

Act-of 1934 is further amended-
(1) by striking the last sentence of subsection (a);
(2) in subsection (bX1), by striking "April 1, 1987" and insert-

ing "October 1, 1991"; and
(3) in subsection (dX1)-

(A) by striking out "to the following radio services:" and
inserting "(A) to governmental entities and nonprofit enti-
ties licensed in the following radio services:"; and

(B) by inserting "(B)" after "Emergency Radio, or".
(c) EIFyc'rvg DATE; IMPLEMErNATIoN.-The amendments made by

this section shall take effect on the date of enactment of this Act,
and the Schedule of Charges required by the amendment made by
subsection (a) of this section shall be implemented not later than 150
days after the date of enactment of this Act

SEC. 3002. FINES AND PENALTIES UNDER THE COMMUNICATIONS ACT OF
1934.

(a) DISCRIMNATION AND PREFERENCE BY COMMON CARRR.--Sec-
tion 202(c) of the Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 202(c)) is
amended-

(1) by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000"; and
(2) by striking "$25" and inserting "$300".

(b) FAILURE IN FILING OF SCHEDULE OF CHAROEs.-Section 203(e) of
such Act (47 U.S.C. 203(e)) is amended-

(1) by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000"; and
(2) by striking "$25" and inserting "$300".

(c) NONCOMPLIANCE WITH RATE ORDERs.-Section 205(b) of such
Act (47 U.S.C. 205(b)) is amended by striking "$1,000" and inserting
"$12,000".

(d) NONCOMPLIANCE WITH LINE EXTENSION ORDEs.--Section
214(d) of the Act (47 U.S.C. 214(d)) is amended by striking "$100" and
inserting "$1,200".

(e) FAILURS TO FILE REPORTS OR INFORMATION.-Section 219(b) of
the Act (47 U.S.C. 219(b)) is amended by striking "$100" and insert-
ing "$1,200".

(f) RECORDKEEPING FAILuREs.-Section 220(d) of the Act (47 U.S.C.
220(d)) is amended by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000".

(g) NONCOMPLIANCE WITH SHIPBOARD RADIO REQURMEmNTs.--Sec-
tion 364 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 362) is amended-

(1) by striking "$500" in subsection (a) and inserting "$5,000";
and

(2) by striking "$100" in subsection (b) and inserting "$1,000".
(h) NONCOMPLIANCE WITH PAsSENOER VESSEL RADIO REQumE-

Marrs.-Section 386 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 386) is amended-.
(1) by striking "$500" in subsection (a) and inserting "$5,000";

and
(2) by striking "$100" in subsection (b) and inserting "$1,000".

(i) GgNURAL FoRPFETURES.-Subsection:(b) of section 503 of the
Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 503(b)) is amended- -

:, (1) by inserting "(1)" after "Ab)" at the beginning 'of such
subsection; and

(2) by striking paragraph (2) and inserting the following-
5644

103 STAT. 2131



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2132

"(2XA) If the violator is (i) a broadcast station licensee or permit-
tee, (ii) a cable television operator, or (iii) an applicant for any
broadcast or cable television operator license, permit, certificate, or
other instrument or authorization issued by the Commission, the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this section
shall not exceed $25,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $250,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

"(B) If the violator is a common carrier subject to the provisions of
this Act or an applicant for any common carrier license, permit,
certificate, or other instrument of authorization issued by the
Commission, the amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under
this subsection shall not exceed $100,000 for each violation or each
day of a continuing violation, except that the amount assessed for
any continuing violation shall not exceed a total of $1,000,000 for
any single act or failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this
subsection.

"(C) In any case not covered in subparagraph (A) or (B), the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this subsection
shall not exceed $10,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $75,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

"(D) The'amount of such forfeiture penalty shall be assessed by
the Commission, or its designee, by written notice. In determining
the amount of such a forfeiture penalty, the Commission or its
designee shall take into account the nature, circumstances, extent,
and gravity of the violation and, with respect to the violator, the
degree of culpability, any history of prior offenses, ability to pay,
and such other matters as justice may require.".

Subtitle B-NRC User Fees
SEC. 3201. NRC USER FEES

Section 7601 of the Consolidated Omnibus Budget Reconciliation
Act of 1985 (COBRA) (Public Law 99-272) is amended to read as
follows:

"(1) IN oaGweL.--The Nuclear Regulatory Commission shall
assess and collect annual charges from its licensees on a fiscal
year basis, except that--

"(A) the maximum amount of the aggregate charges
assessed'pursuant to this paragraph in any fiscal year may
not exceed an amount that, when added to other amounts
collected by the' Commission for such fiscal year under

-other' provisions of law, is estimated to be-equal to 33
percent of the costs incurred by the Commission with re-
spect to such-fiscal year except that for fiscal year 1990
such manimum amount shall be estimated to be equal to 45

· percent of the costs incurred by the Commission for fiscal
year 1990; and ;

"(B) any such charge assessed pursuant to'this paragraph
' shall be reasonably related to the regulatory service pro-

vided by the Commission and shall fairly reflect the cos to
.the Commission of providing such service.

5645



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC . 19, 1989

Public Law 101-239
101st Congress
[H.R. 3299]

To provide for reconciliation pursuant to section 5 of the concurrent resolution on the
budget for the fiscal year 1990.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States ofAmerica in Congress assemblel,
SECTION L SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the "Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act
of 1989".

SEC 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Title I-Agriculture and related programe
Title II--tudent loan and pension fiduciary amendments.
Title m-Regulatory agency fees.
Title IV-Cvl erice and postal service programs.
Title V-Veterans programs.
Title VI-Medlcare, medicaid, maternal and child health. and other health provi-

Title VnI-Revenue provisions
Title VIm-Human resource and inoome security provion
Title IX-Offshore oil pollution compensation fund
Title X-Miscellaneous and technical Social Security Act amendments
Title X- llaeou.

TITLE I-AGRICULTURE AND RELATED
PROGRAMS

SEC. 1001. SHORT TITLE TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrL-This title may be cited as the "Agricultural
Reconciliation Act of 1989".

(b) TABLE or CoNTNrs.--The table of contents is as follows:
Sec. 1001. Short title; table of content.
Sec. 1002. Soybea, sunflower, and safflower planting progrun; feed grain acreage

limitation mroram.
Sec. 1003. Reduction odfekiency paymentr for 1990 crops.
Sec. 1004. yment of adance defdency payment.
Sec. 1005. Reucton of expeditures under the export enhanoemen progrm and

for targeted export assistance.
Sec 1006 Purchases of Finandcial Assistance Corporation rtock by Farm Credit

System institutionL
Se 1007. Adjustments in dairy price support program

SEC 1002L SOYBEAN, SUNFLOWER, AND SAFFLOWER PLANTING PRO-
GRAM; FEED GRAIN ACREAGE LIMITATION PROGRAM.L

(a) PLANTING OF SOYBEANS, SUNFLOWRS, AND SfFLOFW RS ON
PRMITIr AcR OAGL-Effective only for the 1990 crops, subsection
(e) of section 504 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (7 US.C. 1464(e)) is
amended to read as follows:

N(e) Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act-

5619

103 STAT. 2106



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2124

TITLE III-REGULATORY AGENCY FEES

Subtitle A-Federal Communications
Commission Fees and Penalties

SEC. 3001. FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION FEES.

(a) UPDATE or FEE ScHEDULe-Section 8 of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 168) is amended by adding at the end thereof
the following:

"(g) Until modified pursuant to subsection (b) of this section, the
Schedule of Charges which the Federal Communications Commis-
sion shall prescribe pursuant to subsection (a) of this section shall be
as follows:

"SCHEDULE OF CHARGES
Service Fee amount

PPIVATE IADIO M1VICuS

1. Marine Coast Stations
a. New License (per station) $70.00
b. Modification of License (per station) .70.00
c. Renewal of License (per statlon)_ 70.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Initial, Modificationr, Extensions) 100.00
e. Assignments (per station) 70.00
L Transfers of Control (per station) 85.00
g. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request) 105.00
(ii) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

2. Ship Stations
a. New License (per application) 85.00
b Modificaton of License (per application). 85.00
c Renewal of License (per application) 35.00
d. Request for Waiver

() Routine (per request)_ _ 105.00
GD Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

a Operational Fixed Microwave 8tations
a. New License (per station) · 155.00
b. Modificaton of lcense (per station) 155.00
c Renwal of Len (per station) 155.00
d. Special Temporary Authority (Inital. Modifications, Extensions.a) 5.00
a. Aasignments (per station) 15500
f Transfers of Control (per stat io) 5.00
g. Request for Waiver

(I) Routine (per request) 10S00
(iI) Non-Routine (per rule section/per'station) 105.00

4. AviatUon (Ground 8tions)
a. New License (per station) 70.00
b. Modification of Lcense (per station)_ 70.00-
c. Renewal of License (per station) '70.00
d. 8pecial Temporary Authority (nitial, Modifictn, Etensi). .100.00
e. Asignents (per station) 70.00
f Transfers of Control (per station) 38500.
g. Request for Waiver

-i) Routine (per reqet) 105.00
(iD Non-Route (per rule ection/per sta 105.00

Arciaft Stations
a. New ILaense (per plicaton) 3 .-500

Modification Lcese (per appiation) 8600
c. Renewal f Tc s r appiati) 35.00
d. Request forWdver

0) Routine (per adx4 ' '/ 105
fD NonRoutine steerruh xcL dionn lO 105.00

Land Mobie Radio tati andsdin l pedl Emerency and Pulc'
8afety Stations) -
a. Nw Icem (per ca sgn) ..800

5637



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, -1989

b..Modlficaton of License (pr call gn) . 85.00
a Renewal of ce (per call sign) 85.00
d Special Temporar Authority anital, Modifications, Extendon_ 800
_. Assinments (per station) 86.00
L Transfers of Control (per call sign) 85.00
g Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request) 105.00
() Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

h. Reinstatement (per call In) 5.00
L Speciaized Mobile Radio Sytem-Base Stations

(I) New Iicens (per call sign) 85.00
(ii) Modificaton of Lcense (per call dgn) S5.00
(li) Renewal of License (per call dgn) S6.00
(iv) Waiting Lit (annual charge per applicaion) _. 6.00
(v) .Special Temporary Authority (Ind l Modlfcations, Exten-

ao) _ __ 83500
(v) Assignments (per call dsign) mm__ _-_ .00
(vii) Transfers of Control (per call sign) 85.00
(viii) Request for Waiver

(1) Routine (per requet) 105.00
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

(ix) Renstatements (per call sign). 35.00
j. Private Carrier Licenses

(i) New License (per call sign)_ ..... 800
(ii Modification of License (per call sign) 3.00
(lii) Renewal of License (p call ign) 00
(iv) Special Temporary Authority (Initil4 Modcation E n-

dons) 86.00
(v) Assignments (per call sign)..... 5.00
(vi) Transfers of Control (per call sign) 8 5.00
(vii) Requet for Waiver

(1) Routine (per request) . 10500
(2) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

(viii) Reinstatementa (per call dgn) 35.00
7. General Mobile Radio Service

a. New License (per call sign) 35..... .00
b. Modifications of License (per call sign) .-- 00
c. Renewal of License (per call sign):. 85.00
d. Request for Waiver

(i) Routine (per request)_ ....... 1000
(i) Non-Routine (per rule section/per station) 105.00

e. Special Temporary Authority (Inital, Modifiatons, Etenon) 85.00
L Transfer of control (per call sign) - 3.00

8 Restricted Radiotelephone Operator Perm ................................. 35.00
9. Request for Duplicate Station Linse (all services) .00
10. Hearing (Comp'ratlve, New, and Modifications) 6,760.00

QUMPIUVT APPROV/AL Wv'AV / nUM.3 AL RAmo

L Certrfication
a. Receivers (except TV and FM receivers) 28S.00
b. All Other Devices . 00
c. Modfications and Class II Permissive Changes - 00
d. Request for Confidentiality - .. 1000

5! Type Acceptance
a. Al Device .... 70.00
b. Modifications and Clam II Permissive Changes . 6300
C. Request for Confidentiallty. 105.00

3. Ipe pproval l devices)
. Wit Testng (Including Major Modfications).- L1465.00

b WVtbout Testg (Incluadng Mlnor __ 170.00
c Req t for dCoident ay 105.00

4. NotRestiot ...115.00
Advance Aproval for Subscriptio TV System 6- .00

a Request for Oonidentlty . 1.&00
. Asignment of Gratee Code for Eqpment Identificaton :300

7. perimental Radio Service
a. Newr Conructon Permit and Station Authorizatio (per app
'- tion) , 8 t°°

b. Modiftcatoli tb Exlting Construction Permit and Station Autbhor-
sao tion (per appictat '........ 3:.00

c. Renewal of tatin Authorzaton (per applcation) 3a
5638

103 STAT. 2125



PUBLIC IAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

d gnment or Transfer of Control (per applcation) 5.00
e. Special Tempary Authority (per applica tion) ............ 35.00
f.Additional Chug for Appliatom Cotaning Requsts to With-

bold Informaon From Pub Inspection (per application) : 856.00
MA. . .U''D

L Commeial TV 8tations
a. Newor Major Change Construction Perm n .. 2,5.00
b. Mnor hange 6655.00
C. Hearing (Maor/Minor Cuange, Comparative New, or Comprative

Renewalb......... 6,760.00
d _ ... 170.00
a. Asignment or Tansfer

(i) 1ong Form (Forms 314/315) 65.00
(i) Short Form (Form 316) 80.00

£Pen. 0n-' 100.00
Call Sign (New or Modificatn) 65.00
Spedal Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or

extend an existing 8TA to remain silent) ... 100.00
L Extensidon of Time to Construct or Replacement of C P _ 200.00
1 Permit to Deliver Prograsm to Foreign Broadcast 8tations 65.00
E Petition for Rulemakin for New Community of Llcnse 1,665.00
LOwnerhleport (per report) _ 85.00

29 Commerd io 8tat
a New and Major Cnge Construction Permit

) AM Station 255.00
(1i) FM Station 2,030.00

b Minor Change
(i) AM 8tation 56.00
(ii) FM Station .. 566500

. ern (Major/Mlinor Cange, Comparative New, or Compative 6760.00

d. License
(i) AM 370.00
(iU) FM. 115600
(i) AM Diretional Ant_.. 425.00
(iv) FM Directional Antenna. 855.00
(v) AM Remote Control 300

a. Assignmnt or Transfer
(1) lang Form (Forms 814815) 665.00
(IU bShort Form (Form 816) _ ____ 80.00
L wwr Ir -- 100.00

f. Coll 8i gn~r ( ower Modifition) _ _ : ::-.................................. 55.00
Sh pcial T8 mpors_-y Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend n exsting 8TA to remain silent) 100.00

L E nsn of Time to Consuct or Replacement of CP 200.00
Permt to Deliver Pr ams to Foreign Brodcast Station 5 6500t. Petition for Rulemaking for New Community of IcsTe or Higher

aO l . ,a, _bmo 1,565.00
L Owehp Report (per report) .300

S. FM Tra
a. New or Major Change Construction Permit 425.00
b. Licen e 85.00
a. Assignment or Transfer 80.00
d Renewal 3. 00
a. 8pecial Temporary Authority (other than to remain .lent or

extend an e TA to remain slent ......... 100.00
4. TV Trhanslato and IPTV Stations

a. New or MaJor C ge Construction Permt .. 425.00
Assignmnt or Transfer 80.00

d. Irmy.-am 35.00
C. 8pectal Temporrvy Authority (other than to remain silent or.

* tend an existing 8TA to rmain silent) , . 100.0
& AuilL Bar e o ancludes Remote Picp stations, TV Auxillar

Bradcsstations, Aural Bradcast 8TL Intercity Relay sttons,
and Low PoWer Auxiary . st"atn)

oa.i M:r ' · .00
b Renea .. '' · · 85.00
c. Special T Authority (other than to remain sint or.

extend aexisting 8TA to remain nt)....... 100.00
5639

'10.3 STAT;. 2126



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--LDEC- 19 ,-19 8 9

L FJAITV Boosters
a New and Major Change Conxtructloi Permits .. ;: 42.00
b.Lcene .. : 8500
C. 8pecial Temporary Authority -(other than to remaln silent or

extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00
7. International Broadcast Station

a. New Construction Permit and Facilities Change CP - 1,705.00
b. License. ·: : -88. 00
c. Assignment or Transfer (per station) : 60.00
d. Renewal 9500
e. Frequency Assignment and Coordination (per frequency hour): 83500
C Special emporary Authority (other than to remain pilent or

extend an existing STA to remain silent) '100.00
8. Cable Television Service

a. Cable Television Relay Service
(i) Construction Permit ... . 15500
(ii) Assignment or Transfer 166.00
(ll) Renewal ' 155.00
(}v) Modifiaton .... 1 5.00
(v) Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or

extend an exsting STA to remain silent) 100.00
b. Cable Special Relief Petition 790.00
c. 76.12 Registration Statement (per statement) 85.00
d. Aeronautical Frequency Usage Notificatons (per note.............. 00
a. Aeronautical Frequenc Usage Waivers (per waiver) 85.00

9. Direct Broadcast Satellite
a. New or Major Change Construction Permit

(i) Application for Authorization to Construct a Direct Broadcast
8atellite ,_ 2,030.00

(i Issuance of Construction Permit & Launch Authority _ 19,710.00
(li) License to Operate Satellite._ 665.00

b. Hearing (Comparative New, Major/Minor Modifications, or Com-
parative Renewal) ............ _ 6,760.00c. Special Temporary Authority (other than to remain silent or
extend an existing STA to remain silent) 100.00

coMMON CAR.RI= ,Mw 'V

1. All Common Carrier Services
a. Hearing (Comparative New or Major/Minor ModficatiEws) . 6760.00
b Development Authority ... Same charge as regular authorbityn

service unless otherwie indicated
c Formal Complaints and Poble Attachment Complaints Fling Fee 12.00

2. Domestic Public Lad Mobile Stations (includes B , Dispatch,
trol & Repeater Stations)
a. New or Addition Facility (pertransmitter) . 230.00
b. Major Modifications (per transmitter) 2 0.00
c. Fill In Transmitters (per transmitter) 280.00
d Major Amendment to a Pending Application (per tranmi :tter)_. 230.00
e. Am inment or Transfer

(I) Firat Call Sign on A pplication ' : 280.00
(LI) Each Additional Call Sign _& _600

Pnari l s(psier cl e d sn) _ _g n ) 00Renewal (per call sgn) 1I5...
Minwr Modification (per transm itter _ - * :- -85.00

l. Speca Temrpoary Authority (per frequency/per locti - 00.00
Extensio of Time to Construct (per application) 85 00
Notice of Completion of Construction (per appllcatio th . 00

L Auxiliary Tt Station (per transmitter) - 200.00
·n. Subsdiary Communications e (per request) .. 100.0
n. Reinstata t (pr pplitn)- -- : - 8500
a. Combt_ Call i (per c ll dgn) · ' 00
p. Stndby Trm itter (per transm ri0per locaon) 0.00
q. 900 MHs Nation ide -- ::.'-

(I) Re·ewa " :·. :":-J-- - -- s~) .;:
(1) Netw kO- : ' Or _: :'-:.:_l. '00
2) Netwrork Operator (per opertor/pr slty) a 30

r. AhG oud ndividual icense (per staton) .
(i) initial cnue ..... · - i' -i' .00
(I) Renewal of l.cense -- T- .00 . O
:.lllModlflcation of L'c: :.00

.5640

,103 STAT. 2127



-itPUBLIC LAW I 101-239--DEd. 19, ;,989

8. Cellular Systei (per system) . ....
. New orAd itionl FaciUtie_ . 230.00

b. a Wor' Modification 2.0.00
C. Mlor Modifieatio ' ' 6000
d. Assignment or Tranfer (including partial) 23000
. license to Cover Construction ·

... 1) Initial License for Wireline Carrier ' ' 695.00
(U) Subsequent License for Wireline Carrier 60.00
(U) License for Nonwireline Carrier . 60.00
(iv) Fill In License (all carriers) 60.00

f. Renewal ... 5.00
.Extrension of Time to Complete Construction _ 35.00

h. Special Temporary Authorit (per system)..... 200.00
i Combining Cellular Geographic Service Areas (per system) ............. 50.00

4. Rural Radio (includes Central Office, Interoffice, or Relay Faciltis)
a Now or Additional Facility (per transmitter) 105.00
b. Major Modification (per transmitter) ........ 105.00
c. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmitter) 105.00
d. Minor Modification (per transmitter) 85.00
e. Assignments or Transfers

(i) First Call Sign on Applic ati on ............. -105.00
(ii) Each Additional Call Sign 85.00
(lii) Partial Assignment (per call sign) 105.00

f. Renewal (per call sign). ,5.00
Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per application). 86.00

h Notice of Completion of Construction (per applction) 35.00
L Special Temporary Authorty (per frequency/per location) 200
1 Reimnstatement (per apprlcatunn 35.00
iL Combining Call Signs (per call sign). 200.00
L Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter). 200.00
m. Standby Transmitter (per transmitter/per location) 200.00

5. Offshore Radio Service (Mobile. Suberiber, and Central Stations;fees
would also apply to any expansion of this service into coestal waters
other than the Gulf of Mexico)
a New or Additional Facility (per transmitter) 105.00
b. Major Modifications (per transmitter) 105.00
c. Fill In Transmitters (per transmi tter)__ 105.00
d. Major Amendment to Pending Application (per transmnltter) 105.00
e. Minor Modfication (per transmitter) 85.00
f. Assinment or Transfer

)Each Additional Call Sign 35.00
(i) Partial Assignment (per call 105.00

g Renewal (per call slgn) .. 35.00
Extension of Time to Complete Construction (per application) 86, 5.00

L Reinstatement (per application) 5.00
J. Notice of Completion of Construction (per pplica ............ 85.00
iL Special Temporary Authority (per frequency/per locaton) 200.00
L Combining Call Signs (per call sign) 200.00
m Auxiliary Test Station (per transmitter) .. 200.00
n. Standby Transmitter (per transmitter/ per location) 200.00

6: Point-to*Point Microwave and Local Television Radio Service
a. Conditional icense (per station). ..... 1.00
b. Major Modification of Conditional icense or license Autoriza

tion (per station) ................................... ....... 1500
c. Crtfication of Completion of Construction (per tion) .1565.00
d. Renewal (per licensed station).... 1500
a. Aidgnment or Transfer

(i) First Station on Application 55.00
GDi) Fach Additional Station .· S600

£ Extesndon of Construction Authorization (per etation) . . .00
g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prbr Co

,tructn Autborization (per ) 70.00
7.'Multipoint Distribution Servic (ineludn multichannel MDS) -

a:- Conditional lee (per station) . : 16500
bi L-a aodffIrtion of Conditional icense or l anse Authorza. .-

tion(perstUon) : 15500
'C certfiation of Compbletion of Constr o (per channe l) : 465.00

. Reewal (per licensed statio................ 00· .' lunent or ler . .. .- . 1 :5~.e'AsslotorTraanser . .,.
. .(D 1 Station an Application ... 64..:00 Each Additional liation _ __ 00

5j64!L

E03 STAT~, 2128



103 STAT.: 2129 PUBLIC LAW 10i-239--DEC. ' i9,:i989

£ Extension of Construction Authorizatio (per station)_ _____ 110.00
g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-struction Authorization (per request) 70.00

gital Electron Mesae Sice
a. Conditional icnse er nodal station) O' 1500

Modification of Conditional cene or i Authortlo (per
nodal staton). 1656.00

c. Certification of Completion of Construction (er nodal staton) 155.00
d Renewal (per licensed nodal station) 155.00
e. Ae.*nment or Transfer

(V Fist Station on Applcation 6 55.00
(Ii) Each Additional Station ,5_ 39.00

t Extenion of Construction Authorization(per sttion) 55.00
g. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver of Prior Con-

struction Authorization (per request) -: 70.00
9.' nternational Fixed Public Radio (Public and Control Stations)

a. Initial Construction Permit (per station) 610.00
b Assignent or Transfer (per application) 610.00
C Renewal (per license) 870.00
d. Modification (per station)-.- - 870.00

Etenion of Construction Authorization (per station) ............ 185.00
f. Special Temporary Authority or Request for Waiver (per reques)_ 185.00

10. Fixed Satellite Tranlt/Recive Earth Stations
a. Initial Application (per station). 1,525.00b. Modification of License (per staton) - 105.00
c. Assignment or Transfer

(i F)r Station on Application .... .. 0.00
(ii) Each Additional Station __ . 100.00

d. Developmental Station (per station) 1,000.00
e. Renewal of License (per station)) 105.00
f. Special Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction Au-

tbortiztion (per requectV ....- 105.00
.Amendment o Application (per station) 105.00
. Extenion of Construction Permit (per station) ........ _ 105.001 Small Transmit/Receive Earth Stations (2 meters or leo and operat-
_ ng in the 4/6 GHz frequency band)

. Ld Application 8,380.00
b. Routine Application (per station) ._ 35.00c. Modification of License (per station) ...... 105.00
d. Amignent or Transfer

( Ft Station on Application ._ . 300.00a Each Additi l Station _ oo00
a. Developmental Station (per station) 1,00000
f. Renewa of License (per station) _ 10&00
. Special Temorary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction

Authorition (per requutt) 105.00
h. Amendment of Application (per station) 105.00
L Extension of Construction Permit (per station) 105.00

12 Receive Only Earth Stations
a. Inital Application for Regitration 238.0
b. Modification of License or Registration (per station) 1056.00
c. Asigamuent or TraLfer

(1) rst Station on Application 800.00
' ) Each Additional tatlon 100.00

d.Re l iof lcense (per Aatbo) -105.00
·e. Amendment of Appl{ation (per station) . O.. 00f Extension ofConstrction Permit (per station) .......... . 10.00
IWaivers requed).. - : - 105.00

'I ,. .nulltu Tenrminal (V8AT) Systeme

b. U of oi ee (per , 1.. m)
C. Assiment or Trnfer of _r - :.160.DeelopannA: Station_ . 1,000.00a. Renew a do e (per system) . , ..10500

peal Tempory Authority or Waivers of Pror'Co ruction A
I' thori(peatiir wrem:Ue 'q. e105.00

Et' eion Of Conr ction Pemit (per system) 106.00
14. Mobile Satellite Earth Stations

a. Initial Applatn of Blanket Authorizato ' . . . 6o
b. nitil Appliation for Ilndividual Earth Station 1850.00

5642



:PUBLIC LAWt101-239--DDC. 19, 1989 103 STAT. 2130

. Modification of License (per s.tem) 105.00
:: d. Adgment or Tranfer (per system) 1,505.00
,a e.Devlopmental Station . 1,000.00

£ Renesal of l ene (perq m) 105.00
'g. Spedal AthltY ar Waivers of Prio r O tion

uthoraton (per request) . 105.00
Amendment of Application (per ystem) 105.00

L Extension of Contrution Permit (er system) 105.00
1. Radio determinatlon Satellite Earth Statibns

a. Initial Application of Blanket Authoriztion 6,630.00
K Initial Appliction for Individual Earth Station 1,350.00
c. Modilfcatlon of License (per system) 105.00
d. Assinment or Transfer (per system) 1,505.00
.Developmental Station 1,000.00

f. Renewal of llcenae (per system) 105.00
g. Sp6cla Temporary Authority or Waivers of Prior Construction

Authorization (per rqsrt 105.00
h.-Amendment of Application (per system) 105.00
L Extension of Constructi Permit (per _jt rm) 105.00

16Space Stations - .
a Application for Authority to Construct 2,030.00
b Appl/ation for Authority to Launch & Operate

) Initial Application 70,000.00
:- . ) Replacement Satellte ..___ __ _ 70,000.00

c. A gnent o Transfer (per satellite) 5,000.00
d Modifies ao. 5,000.00
a Special Temporary Authority or Waiver of Prior Construction Au-

thorizatlin (per request) 500.00
f: Amendment of Application ....... 1,000.00
g. Extension of Construction Permit/Launch Authorization (per re-

quest) 500.00
17. Section 214 Applications

a. Overseas Cable Contruction . 9.125.00
h Cable Landing License

(I) Common Carrier .. 1,025.00
(ii) Non-Common Carrier 10,150.00

c. Domestic Cable Constructior 610.00
d. AU Other 214 Applications 610.00

Special Temporary Authority (all serces) . 610.00
L A nment or WTnsfers (all services) .610.00

18. ____=i' Private Operating Status (per application)..... 610.00
19. Telephone Equipment Registration 155.00
20. Filing

-,a Filing Fee . 90.00
h Special Permission Filing (per filing) 490.00

2L Acounting and Audits
a Field Audit 62290.00
K Review of Attest Audit ...... 8,000.00
' . Review of Deprecation Update Study (Sngle State) 20,685.00

(i) Each Additional State _._ 680.00
'd. Interpretation of Accounting Rules (per request 2,885.00
a. Petition for Waiver (per petition) 4,660.00

MI ' ' '' ' CHAIIX.

1. International Tlecommunications Settlements Administrative Fee for,
Collections (per line Item)_ L00

2. Radio Operator Examinations
a Commercial Radio Operator Examination 35.00
h Renewal of Commercial Radio Operator Ucense Permit, or Crtif-

icate -'5.00
'c' Duplicate or ReplacementCommercal Radio Operator cense,

Permit, or Certificte 5. 00
8 8hip Inspectionsr

a. pec of Ocii Vessels Under nti. mIL Part I.f the
Comnnuncitions Act (per inspection) 620.00

Inspectionof Passenger Vessels Under Title 111Part of the '
-,..Communicatios:uAct,(perins8ton) .-· 200

c lIanp6cti' of VeeL Uder the Cret ake Agreement (per in- n ..-
pection) 860.00

-,; - n 47- A ~5643



PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DHE. 19, 1989

d. Inspection of Foreign Vessels Under the Safety of Life At Sea
.SOLAS) Convention (per inspection) . 0.00

- Temporary ,Waiver for Compulsorily Equipped Vessel - 60.00".
(b) CoNvoRwNG Ao.D Muas--Section 8 of the Communications

Act-of 1934 is further'amended-
(1) by striking the last sentence of subsection (a);
(2) in subsection (bXl), by striking "April 1, 1987" and insert-

ing "October 1, 1991"; and
(8) in subsection (dXl)-

(A) by striking out "to the following radio services" and
inserting "(A) to governmental entities and nonprofit enti-
ties licensed in the following radio services."; and

(B) by inserting "(B)" after "Emergency Radio, or".
(c) EFFSECv DATE; ImPLEMENrATION.-The amendments made by

this section shall take effect on the date of enactment of this Act,
and the Schedule of Charges required by the amendment made by
subsection (a) of this section shall be implemented not later than 150
days after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC 3002. FINES AND PENALTIES UNDER THE COMMUNICATIONS ACT OF
1934.

(a) DIMCRIMINArON AND PREFERENCE BY COMMON CARREL--Sec-
tion 202(c) of the Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 202(c)) is
amended-

(1) by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000"; and
(2) by striking "$25" and inserting "$300".

(b) FAILURE IN FImINa OF SCHEDULE OF CHARGEs.-Section 203(e) of
such Act (47 U.S.C. 203(e)) is amended-

(1) by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000"; and
(2) by striking "$25" and inserting "$300".

(c) NONCOMPLIANCE WITH RATE ORDEas.-Section 205(b) of such
Act (47 U.S.C. 205(b)) is amended by striking "$1,000" and inserting
"$12,000".

(d) NONCOmPLIANCE WITH LINE EXTENsiN ORDER.--Section
214(d) of the Act (47 U.S.C. 214(d)) is amended by striking "$100" and
inserting "$1,200".

(e) FAILURE To FILE REPORT8 OR INFORMATION.-Section 219(b) of
the Act (47 U.S.C. 219(b)) is amended by striking "$100" and insert-
ing "$1,200".

(f) RscORDcKEPINO FAIuREs.-Section 220(d) of the Act (47 U.&C.
220(d)) is amended by striking "$500" and inserting "$6,000".

(g) NONCOmPLANCE WrTH SHIPBOARD RADIO RsqmnuEwr--$Sec-
tion 864 of such Act (47 US.C. 362) is amended-

(1) by striking "$500" in subsection (a) and inserting "$5,000";
and

(2) by striking "$100" in subsection (b) and inserting "$1,000".
(h) -NONCOMPLIANCE WrrH PAssmENotR VESSEL RADIO RlqUmi-
Naamc.--Section 886 of such Act (47 U.S.C. 386) is amendedi-

(1) by striking "$500" in subsection (a) and inserting "$5,000";
and

(2) by striking "$100" in subsection (b) and Inserting "$1,000".
(i) GENERAL FoRFaTmIua.-Subeection (b) of section 503 of the

Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 603(b)) is amended--
:.-. (1) by. inserting "(1)" after "(bY' at the beginning 'of such
subsection; and
'(2) by striking paragraph (2) and inserting the following

5644-

103 STAT. 21311



.PUBLIC LAW 101-239--DEC. 19, 1989

"(2XA) If the violator is (i) a broadcast station licensee or permit-
tee, (ii) a cable television operator, or (iii) an applicant for any
broadcast or cable television operator license, permit, certificate, or
other instrument or authorization issued by the Commission, the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this section
shall not exceed $25,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $250,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

"(B) If the violator is a common carrier subject to the provisions of
this Act or an applicant for any common carrier license, permit,
certificate, or other instrument of authorization issued by the
Commission, the amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under
this subsection shall not exceed $100,000 for each violation or each
day of a continuing violation, except that the amount assessed for
any continuing violation shall not exceed a total of $1,000,000 for
an single act or failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this
:ubsection.

"(C) In any case not covered in subparagraph (A) or (B), the
amount of any forfeiture penalty determined under this subsection
shall not exceed $10,000 for each violation or each day of a continu-
ing violation, except that the amount assessed for any continuing
violation shall not exceed a total of $75,000 for any single act or
failure to act described in paragraph (1) of this subsection.

"(D) The amount of such forfeiture penalty shall be assessed by
the Commission, or its designee, by written notice. In determining
the amount of such a forfeiture penalty, the Commission or its
designee shall take into account the nature, circumstances, extent,
and gravity of the violation and, with respect to the violator, the
degree of culpability, any history of prior offenses, ability to pay,
and such other matters as justice may require.".

Subtitle B-NRC User Fees
SEC HO0L NRC USER FEES.

Section 7601 of the Consolidated Omnibus Budget Reconciliation
Act of 1985 (COBRA) (Public Law 99-272) is amended to read as
follows:

"(1) IN oaAL.--The Nuclear Regulatory Commission shall
assess and collect annual charges from its licensees on a fiscal
year basis, except that- -

' "(A) the maximum amount of the aggregate charges
' assessed pursuant to this paragraph in any fiscal year may
not exceed an amount that, when added to other amounts
collected by the' Commission for such fiscal year under
'other provisions of law, is estimated to be-equal to 38
percent of the costs incurred by the Commission with re-
spect to. such -fiscal year except that for fiscal year 1990
such.m-aimum amount shall be estimated to be equal to 45

. percent. f the costs incurred.by the Commission for fiscal
year 1990 and .-

"(B) any such cha/ge assessed pursuant to'this paragraph
:sall be.reasonably related to theregulatory service pro-

- vided by the Commission and shall fairly reflect'.the'Cost to
the Commission of providing such service.

5645

103 STAT. 2132


